County of Jefferson

Office of the Purchasing Department
Historic Court House

195 Arsenal Street

Watertown, New York 13601-2565
Phone: 315-785-3077

Fax: 315-785-7591

Buyers
Karin Dorr

Amanda McCracken

Director
Mark Sachetti, CPPB

Email Addresses:
marks@co.jefferson.ny.us
karind@co.jefferson.ny.us

amccracken(@co.jefferson.ny.us
avisg@co.jefferson.ny.us
mshear@co.jefferson.ny.us

Senior Account Clerk
Avis Gilmore

Account Clerk
Mary Ann Shear

APRIL 24, 2023

MR DAVID MARTIN

ADVANCED DRAINAGE SYSTEMS INC

35148 NYS RT 3
CARTHAGE NY 13619

MR CRAIG SHEARER
LANE ENTERPRISES LLC
16 MAY STREET
BATHNY 14810

BID #2023H-9

NOTICE OF AWARD

MR MARC STEMERMAN
CHEMUNG SUPPLY CORP
PO BOX 527

ELMIRA NY 14902

AWARD: BASED ON LOW BID PER TABULATION

CONTRACT PERIOD: MAY 1, 2023 THROUGH APRIL 30, 2025

Dear Mr. Martin, Mr. Stemerman, Mr. Nelson, Mr. Shearer:

MR KEITH NELSON
PRECISION PIPE & PRODUCTS
1806 6™ AVE SOUTH
BIRMINGHAM AL 35210

NAME: DRAINAGE PIPE AND STEEL PLATE FOR PIPE

I am pleased to inform you that your Bid submitted for the solicitation referenced has been accepted based on full
compliance with the specifications, terms and conditions included in the Bid.

Submittal Requirements have been met. The following documents are enclosed or pending:

Purchase Order [ To be issued

If you have any questions regarding this notice of award, please call the Jefferson County Purchasing Department.

Sincerely,

A

Mark Sachetti, Purchasing Director

MS/kd

L

C:  Department, Auditor, Bid File, Town & County Bridge & Rail

SHARED/BIDS/HIGHWAY BID BOOK 2023-2025/AWARD 2023H-9



BID #2023H-9

BID TABULATION

DRAINAGE PIPE AND STEEL PLATE FOR PIPE

2023-2025 BID PRICING

ADVANCED RECISION PIPE e
CHEMUNG DRAINAGE & PRODUCTS COCITEY
SUPPLY CORP. SYSTEMS INC INC BRIDGE & RAIL
INC
PART |
A. ROUND CORRUGATED STEEL PIPE, PIPE ARCHES AND END SECTIONS
ITEM
4 PLAIN GALVANIZED PRICE [ FOOT PRICE /| FOOT PRICE [ FOOT PRICE [ FOOT
DIAMETER GA
SEE PRICING
1 12 1 A NO BI BID
4 #2353 - e FROM ADS
SEE PRICING
18 1 .90 D NO BID
2 4 ¥35-9 NO B FROM ADS
: SEE PRICING
2 1 8. NO BI BID
- 4 4 +48.47 0 e FROM ADS
SEE PRICING
0 1 62.72 NO BID
4 3 4 =e2i) NOBIR FROM ADS
SEE PRICING
6 12 133.28 NO BI BID
5 3 ¥133 b NO FROM ADS
SEE PRICING
2 1.70 NO B BID
6 4 12 $121.7 OBID NO FROM ADS
SEE PRICING
8 .6 BID
7 4 10 $213.64 NO BID NO _ FROM ADS
SEE PRICING
60 . BID
8 10 $255.55 NO Bl‘D NO FROM ADS
SEE PRICING
66 . BID
9 10 $274.05 NO BID NO FROM ADS
SEE PRICING
A BID
10 72 10 $292.55 NO BID NO FROM ADS
SEE PRICING
8 X1 1. N BID
11 1 14 $31.42 OBID NO FROM ADS
SEE PRICING
X1 .8 BID
12 22 X13 14 $37.81 NO BID NO FROM ADS
SEE PRICING
X18 . BID
13 29 14 $52.22 NO BID NO FROM ADS
SEE PRICING
6 66. BID
14 36X22 14 $66.63 NO BID NO FROM ADS
SEE PRICING
: X 1 8.84 - NO BID O BI G e s
18] 43X27 2 $138.84 N D FROM ADS
SEE PRICING
1 X 31 .81 N BID
6 50 X3 12 $139 OBID NO FROM ADS
SEE PRICING
8 8. BID
17| 58X36 12 $148.42 NO BID NO FRON ADS
SEE PRICING
.95 NO BI
18| 72X44 12 $261.95 NO BID D FROM ADS
SEE PRICING
1 X 12 279.50 NO BI _ NO BID
9] 79X49 $279.5 D 186, FROM ADS
$2,617.99 _ $1,779.92




BID #2023H-9

BID TABULATION

DRAINAGE PIPE AND STEEL PLATE FOR PIPE

2023-2025 BID PRICING
TOW
ADVANCED RECISION PIPE OWN &
CHEMUNG COUNTY
SUPPLY CORP BRAMNRGE & PRODUCTS BRIDGE & RAIL
" | SYSTEMS INC INC
INC
END SECTION
DIAMETER GA
SEE PRICING
. NO BID
1 12 14 $141.70 NO BID FROM ADS
SEE PRICING
A Bl
2 18 14 $225.23 NO BID NO BID FROM ADS
SEE PRICING
6. NO BID
3 24 14 $326.49 NO BID FROM ADS
SEE PRICING
4 30 14 $618.39 NO BID NO BID FROM ADS
SEE PRICING
823.6 NO BID
5 36 12 $823.69 NO BID ) FROM ADS
SEE PRICING
6 42 12 $1,413.50 NO BID NO BID FROM ADS
SEE PRICING
.88 B NO BID
7 48 10 $1,719 NO BID FROM ADS
8 60 10 $2 6 NO BID NO BID SEEFRICING
194403 FROM ADS
SEE PRICING
9 66 10 $3,226.58 NO BID NO BID FROMADS
SEE PRICING
10 72 10 $4,150.27 NO BID NO BID FROM ADS
SEE PRICING
11 18 X1 14 $159.94 NO BID NO BID FROM ADS
SEE PRICING
. B
12 22 X 13 14 $195.26 NO BID NO BID FROM ADS
SEE PRICING
X Bl
13 29 X18 14 $271.85 NO BID NO BID FROM ADS
SEE PRICING
14| 36X22 14 $454.91 NO BID NO BID FROM ADS
SEE PRICING
15| 43X27 12 $738.59 NO BID NO BID FROM ADS
SEE PRICING
16 50 X 31 12 $1,236.02 NO BID NO BID FROM ADS
17 8X36 12 $1,563.2 NO BID ‘NO BID SEEPRICING
5673 50327 FROM ADS
18 2X 12 $2,496 NO BID NO BID SEERRICING
72X 44 ,»496.97 FROM ADS
~ 81X59 SEE PRICING
X 12 223.52 NO BID S n NO BID
9] 79X49 #3235 | $2,432.04 FROM ADS
$25,930.69 - $25,722.61




BID #2023H-9
DRAINAGE PIPE AND STEEL PLATE FOR PIPE

BID TABULATION

2023 - 2025 Bid Pricing

ADVANCED | PRECISION TOWN &
DRAINAGE PIPE & COUNTY
SYSTEMS | PRODUCTS | BRIDGE AND
INC INC RAIL INC
PART |
B1. HEAVY DUTY ROUND STEEL PIPE
HEAVY DUTY STEEL CULVERT PIPE
PRICE/FOOT | PRICE/FOOT | PRICE/FOOT | PRICE/[FOOT
DIAMETER THICKNESS / / : / /
DELIVERED | DELIVERED | DELIVERED | DELIVERED
SEE PRICING
12" h teel pi 1/4" B B
eavy steel pipe /4" or more NO BID NO BID NO BID FROM ADS
SEE PRICING
20" he teel pi 16" NO BI NO B NO BI
avy steel pipe | 5/16" or more O BID O BID OBID FROM ADS
SEE PRICING
24" he teel pi 16" NO BI N NO BI
4 avy steel pipe | 5/16" or more O BID O BID OBID FROM ADS
SEE PRICING
6" heavy steel pipe 8" or mor NO BID NO BID NO BID
36" heavy steelpipe | 3/8" or more FROM ADS
SEE PRICING
8" h l H ]
4 eavy steel pipe 1/2" or more NO BID NO BID FROM ADS
SEE PRICING
60" he teel pi 12 NO BI NO BI
avy steel pipe [2" or more OBID O BID FROM ADS
, ' SEE PRICING
2" h l H "
7 eavy steel pipe 1/2" or more NO BID NO BID FROM ADS
SEE PRICING
84" heavy steel pi 12" NO BI NO BID
4" heavy steel pipe [2" or more D FROM ADS
SEE PRICING
6" h | pi 1/2" NO BI
9 eavy steel pipe /2" or more NO BID O BID EROM ADS
SEE PRICING
1/2" or more NO BID NO BID

120" heavy steel pipe

FROM ADS




BID #2023H-9
DRAINAGE PIPE AND STEEL PLATE FOR PIPE
BID TABULATION

2023 - 2025 Bid pricing

ADV \\ TY
CHEMUNG |0 e *BiineEAliD
SUPPLY CORP
SYSTEMS INC RAIL INC
PART I
B2. HEAVY DUTY SMOOTH STEEL PIPE ARCHES/LINERS
Existing Pipe Liner Pipe
PRICE/FOOT PRICE/FOOT PRICE/FOOT PRICE/FOOT
SPAN" X RISE" | THICKNESS / / / /
DELIVERED DELIVERED DELIVERED DELIVERED
SEE PRICING
58 X 36 1/2" or more NO BID NO BID
FROM ADS
SEE PRICING
65 X 40 1/2" or more NO BID NO BID
FROM ADS
SEE PRICING
2 X 112" or NO BID NO BID
A /2" miore FROM ADS
SEE PRICING
X 12" NO BID NO BID
79749 /2 r more FROM ADS
SEE PRICING
85X 1/2" N NO BI
5 X 54 /2" or more O BID OBID FROM ADS
SEE PRICING
87 X6 1M NO BI NO BID
7X63 /2" or more D EROM ADS
SEE PRICING
8X6 1/2" ID NO BI
98 X 69 /2" or more NO B O BID FROM ADS
SEE PRICING
103 X 71 1/2" NO Bl NO BID
3X7 /2" or more D FROM ADS
SEE PRICING
12 X 12" NO B NO BI
75 [2" or more O BID D FROM ADS
SEE PRICING
123 X 81 1/2" or more NO BID NO BID
FROM ADS
SEE PRICING
137 X8 1/2" NO BI NO BI
37 X 87 /2" or more O BID D FROM ADS
SEE PRICING
142 X 91 1/2" or more NO BID NO BID
FROM ADS
SEE PRICING
- 154 X100 1/2" or more NO BID NO BID
FROM ADS
SEE PRICING
159 X 112 1/2" NO BI
59 /2" or more NO BID D FROM ADS
SEE PRICING
168 X 116 12" NO BI NO BI
[2" or more O BID D FROM ADS
SEE PRICING
170 X 118 1/2" or more NO BID NO BID
FROM ADS




BID #2023H-9
DRAINAGE PIPE AND STEEL PLATE FOR PIPE
BID TABULATION

184 X 111 1/2" or more NOBID NO BID ss:;;l/c\ll;\lsc
195 X 121 1/2" or more NO BID NO BID S[EFE;S];E\JSG
198 X 132 1/2" or more NO BID NO BID S;Z;()F’;lilglsG
199 X 121 1/2" or more NO BID NO BID ?ﬁ&&ﬁgf

*Precision Pipe & Products Inc. - Specific liner dimensions to be determined at time of
COMMENTS: purchase. Above prices are firm for truckload quantites. Non- Stock items require
additional delivery time for fabrication.

CHECK VALVES FOR SMOOTH BORE CORRUGATED POLYETHYLENE PIPE:

TIDEFLEX CHECKMATE Ultraflex Check Valve or approved equal as determined by the Superintendent of

In Line, neoprene with slip in cuff connection
I

Gravity Flow Application
[

TIDEFLEX SERIES TF-1 TF-2 and TF 35-1 Curved Bill Culvert Check Valve

or approved equal as determined by the Superintendent of Highways
[ I

Elastomeric Check Valves Eccentric Type

Gravity Flow Application |

AGRI DRAIN Flap Gate Powder coated finish, Heavy duty steel with hinged arm and attachment hardwar

as determined by the Superintendent of Highways

Gravity Flow Application { |

CHEMUNG SUPPLY CORP [ ADVANCED DRAINAGE SYSTEMS INC / PRECISION PIPE &
PRODUCTS INC / TOWN & COUNTY BRIDGE AND RAIL INC
Diameter Checkmate TF-2 TF 35-1 Flap Gate
Ultra Flex ;
12" ' No Bid NoBid | No Bid No Bid
18” No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
24" | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
30” | . NoBid | NoBid | No Bid No Bid




BID #2023H-9
DRAINAGE PIPE AND STEEL PLATE FOR PIPE
BID TABULATION

2023-2025 BID PRICING
CHEMUNG otk
Award made by Section. SUPPLY JDGE AN
F BRIDGE AND
CORP '
RAIL INC
PART | |
C. STORM SEWER PIPE
SMOOTH INTERIOR CORRUGATED POLYETHYLENE PIPE:
o DIAVETER | SURRTITY PRICE/FOOT|PRICE/FOOT| PRICE/FOOT |PRICE/FOOT| PRICE/FOOT
DELIVERED | DELIVERED | DELIVERED | DELIVERED | DELIVERED
See
1 o Attached |  $8.35 NOBID SFE:OPSI%\ISG
ADS Letter
See
R 15" Attached |  $10.94 nosip | S PETS
ADS Letter it
See
3 - i — NG BID SEE PRICING
ADS Letter rROMADS
See
4 24" Attached $25.55 NG BlE S[EREOPI\T;II;\JSG
ADS Letter
See
5 o W 54096 N BID SEE PRICING
ADS Letter e
See ‘
6 36" Attached | $53.05 HESik SE:;ATSSSG
ADS Letter
See :
, a2 Attached | $72.75 HEREE Sf:gn}jxl/ils;
ADS Letter
See
8 48" Attached $90.75 EROHIADS,
ADS Letter FROM e
See
9 60" Attached $167.99 55:;;':;“:
ADS Letter
$486.72
END SECTION POLYETHYLENE PIPE
See
10 12" Attached $284.00 O ADS.
ADS Letter rrom A
. See .
1 15" Attached $284.00 SIE:(:I\F/(IIE\II;‘SG
ADS Letter
See
) . stimebed, | 358mo0 SEE PRICING
ADS Letter romAbs
See
13 24" Attached $490.00 SIE:OPI\TSI;ISG
ADS Letter
See
14 30" Attached NO BID Sf:gfalf\];sc
ADS Letter




BID #2023H-9
DRAINAGE PIPE AND STEEL PLATE FOR PIPE
BID TABULATION

2023-2025 BID PRICING

PRECISION
CHEMUNG c CoUNTY
' PIPE & COUNTY
Award made by Section. SUPPLY
il PRODUCTS | BRIDGE AND
INC RAIL INC
See
SEE PRICING
- 36" Attached NO BID FROM ADS
ADS Letter
PERFORATED SMOOTH BORE CORRUGATED POLYETHYLENE PIPE:
See ‘
v EE PRICING
16 6" Attached |  $4.50 NOBID SFR(:M ADS
ADS Letter
See
SEE PRICING
17 8" Attached $6.50 NOEID FROIS ADS
ADS Letter
See
SEE PRICING
18 2" Attached $8.35 NO BID FROM ADS
ADS Letter '
See
SEEP |
19 18" Attached $16.38 NOER FROATIC\I;\‘SG
ADS Letter
$35.73
REDUCERS FOR SMOOTH BORE POLY PIPE:
See
SEE PRICING
20 6"70 8" 10EA | Attached | $41.90 NOBID | trom ADs
ADS Letter
See
EE PRICING
21 8" TO 12" 10EA | Attached | $149.02 NO BID SFRoPAF; ADS
ADS Letter
See
SEE PRICING
- 12" TO 15" 10EA. | Attached | $313.00 HA BID
FROM ADS
ADS Letter
See
SEE P G
23 15" TO 18" 10 EA. Attached $434.00 NREID i AD:
FROM ADS
ADS Letter
See
EE PRICING
24 18" TO 24" 10 EA. Attached $638.00 HeBD S’FROM ADS
ADS Letter
$1,575.92
ELBOWS FOR SMOOTH BORE POLYETHYLENE:
ltem # 2"
See
SEE PRICING
25 90° Attached | $193.00 NOBID | cromADS
ADS Letter
See
EE PRICING
” 45° Attached | $141.00 NO Bib SFROM ADS
ADS Letter
See
SEE PRICING
27 22.5° Attached | NOBID NOBID | oM ADS
ADS Letter
See
SEE PRICING
,8 TEE Attached | $238.00 NO BID ¢
FROM ADS
ADS Letter




BID #2023H-9
DRAINAGE PIPE AND STEEL PLATE FOR PIPE
BID TABULATION

, ‘ 2023-2025 BID PRICING
| |
| PRECISION | TOWN &
. CHESEING . PIPE & COUNTY
Award made by Section. SUPPLY
CORP PRODUCTS | BRIDGE AND
INC RAIL INC
2 0° Att?ai:med $224.00 NO BID ke
3 K A FROM ADS
ADS Letter
See
SEE PRICING
o] ° X o BI
3 45 Attached $195.00 N D FROM ADS
ADS Letter
1 22.5° Attzi:ed $159.00 NO BID SEE PRICING
3 5 59 FROM ADS
ADS Letter
2 TEE AttSaecied $356.00 NO BID SEE PRICING
3 356 FROM ADS
ADS Letter
18"
See
SEE PRICING
0° ; Bl
33 9 Attached $314.00 NO BID FROM ADS
ADS Letter
See
5 SEE PRICING
34 45 Attached $259.00 NO BID FROM ADS
ADS Letter
See
SEE PRICING
.5° i B
35 22.5 Attached $216.00 NO BID FROM ADS
ADS Letter
See
) SEE PRICING
6 TEE X Bl
3 Attached $500.00 NO BID FROM ADS
ADS Letter
37 ADS INTERNAL HOOD W/12" OUT
24"
See
. SEE PRICING
38 90 Attached $622.40 NO BID FROM ADS
ADS Letter
E Att?aecied $529.02 NO BID SEE FRICING
39 45 529 FROM ADS
ADS Letter
See
& SEE PRICING
40 22.5 Attached $468.00 NO BID FROM ADS
ADS Letter
1 TEE Attsaecied $ 00 NO BID SE~E FAIEING
. 773 FROM ADS
ADS Letter
' ‘ SEE PRICING
ADS INTERNAL HOOD 18" OUT Bl NO BI
42 D RN (0] NO BID NO BID O BID FROM ADS
$5,187.42
COIL STOCK POLYETHYLENE UNDERDRAIN:
n P I"f S
4" REFIeraEd gea o SEE PRICING
43 pipe rolled Attached $0.92 $1.34 NO BID
3 o FROM ADS
stock with sock ADS Letter 2
6" Perf
, erforated See ’ SEE PRICING
44 pipe rolled Attached $2.20 $2.89 NO BID
. FROM ADS
stock with sock ADS Letter




BID #2023H-9

DRAINAGE PIPE AND STEEL PLATE FOR PIPE

BID TABULATION

2023-2025 BID PRICING

PRECISION TOWN
CHEMUNG &
. PIPE & COUNTY
Award made by Section. SUPPLY
PRODUCTS | BRIDGE AND
CORP
INC RAIL INC
8"
.Perforated See SEE PRICING
45 pipe rolled Attached NO BID FROM ADS
stock with sock ADS Letter
4 TErTorateqa See
i lled SEE PRICING
46 stz'ff v:/(i)theout Attached NOBID | cpomADs
A ADS Letter |
O Terroratea See 3 ¥
i lled SEE PRICING
o stzlff v’:/ci}theout Atadhed NOBID | cromADs
. ADS Letter
O TErroratca See
i lled SEE PRICIN
48 stzlf:v:/(i)theout Attached No@Elb FROM ADSG
A ADS Letter |
SDR 35 PIPE:
SEE PRICING
p BID NO BID NO Bl NO BI -
49 4 HE b OBID | rrom ADs
50 6" NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID SEE PRICING
FROM ADS
SEE PRICING
1 8" NO BI BID NO BI NO BI
5 O BID NO D O BID FROM ADS
SEE PRICING
2 10" NO BI NO BID NO BID NO BID
> p © FROM ADS
SEE PRICING
122" NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
>3 FROM ADS
COUPLINGS FOR COIL STOCK:
EE
54 4" NO BID NO BID NoBlD | SEE FaIeING
FROM ADS
SEE PRICING
6" NO Bl NO BID NO BI
25 B D FROM ADS
SEE PRICING
6 8" NO BI NO BID NO BI
> . P | rromADs
COUPLINGS FOR SDR 35:
SEE PRICING
! NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
57 4 FROM ADS
58 6" NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID SEE PRICING
FROM ADS
SEE PRICING
a" NO BI NO BID NO BID NO BI
59 b D FROM ADS
SEE PRICING
60 10" NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
FROM ADS
EE
61 172" NO BID NO BID NO BID NO-BID SEE FRIEING
FROM ADS

COMMENTS |




BID #2023H-9
DRAINAGE PIPE AND STEEL PLATE FOR PIPE
BID TABULATION

2023- 2025 Bid Pricing

PRECISION
ADVANCED LANE TOWN & COUNTY
dmad ion. All ties Awarded | CHE LY PIPE &
Anard méde y:Section fes Awarde MUNG SUPPLY | | e AINAGE SYSTEMS | ENTERPRISES BRIDGE AND RAIL
base on draw from a hat. CORP PRODUCTS
INC LLC INC
INC
PARTI
D: PVC SURFACE DRAINAGE PRODUCTS
PRICE PRICE
OPTIONAL RISER SECTIONS FOR DRAIN PRICE DELIVERED | PRICE DELIVERED PRICE DELIVERED
Item # BASINS: s TEGOT DELIVERED | DELIVERED/  EoOT
) | FOOT FOOT
SIZE
See Attached ADS SEE PRICING
1 10" NO BID Bl NO BID
Letter RO BlD FROM ADS
See Attached ADS SEE PRICING
2 12" NO BID NO Bl NO BID
Letter G Rib FROM ADS
See Attached ADS SEE PRICING
15" NO BID BI NO BID
3 > Letter NOBID FROM ADS
See Attached ADS SEE PRICING
18" B
4 o NO BID NO BID NO BID e OM ADS
See Attached ADS SEE PRICING
24" B
5 4 o NO BID NO BID NO BID e
See Attached ADS SEE PRICING
n
B
6 36 o NO BID NO BID NO BID et A
CURB INLET STRUCTURE:
" ETER X 24" H UP TO TW
12" DIAMETERX 24" TALLWITHUPTOTWO | o o chied ADS SEE PRICING
1 |OUTLETS 4" TO 10" DIAMETER WITH o NO BID NO BID NO BID R OM ADS
STANDARD H-25 GRATE
12" DIAMETER X 24" TALL WITH UP TO TWO
See Attached ADS EE PRICING
> |OUTLETS 4" TO 12" DIAMETER WITH SRAtEchen. Al NO BID NO BID NO BID S
Letter FROM ADS
STANDARD H-25 GRATE
n " T LL
5" DIAMBTERY 4" TALLWITHLPTOTWG | o s tpmhiefl ADS SEE PRICING
3 |OUTLETS 4" TO 12" DIAMETER WITH NO BID NO BID NO BID
Letter FROM ADS
STANDARD H-25 GRATE
" DIAMETER X 30" TALL WITH UP TO TWO
1OSUTDLETS "TO 12" DIAMETER WITH P NO BID NO BID NO BID SEE PRICING
4 * Letter FROM ADS
STANDARD H-25 GRATE
8" DIAMETER X 36" TALL WITH UP TO TWO
1OUTDI_IETS "TO 13" DIAMETER WllJTH See Attached ADS NO BID NO BID NO BID SEE PRICING
> WS Letter FROM ADS
STANDARD H-25 GRATE
" "TALL WIT
18% DIAMETER K36 ITHUPTOTWO | ¢ o Attached ADS SEE PRICING
6 |OUTLETS 4" TO 18" DIAMETER WITH NO BID NO BID NO BID
Letter FROM ADS
STANDARD H-25 GRATE
" ETER X 36" TA TO TW
24" DIAMETER X 36" TALLWITH UPTOTWO | o s¢tached ADS SEE PRICING
7 |OUTLETS 4" TO 18" DIAMETER WITH NO BID NO BID NO BID
Letter FROM ADS
STANDARD H-25 GRATE
" DIAMETER X 36" TALL WITH UP TO TWO
8 ?)4UTDLETS "TO 23 " DIAMETER WITH See Attached ADS NO BID NO BID NO BID RER FIELCHE
4 4 Letter FROM ADS
STANDARD H-25 GRATE




BID #2023H-9

DRAINAGE PIPE AND STEEL PLATE FOR PIPE

BID TABULATION

Award made by Section. All ties Awarded CHEMUNG SUPPLY ADVANCED LANE PR:IEIESI:N TOWN & COUNTY
y - DRAINAGE SYSTEMS | ENTERPRISES BRIDGE AND RAIL
base on draw from a hat. CORP PRODUCTS
INC LLC INC
INC
INLET DRAINS:
[H-10 GRATE
‘ See Attached A SEE PRICING
1 |4" WITH STANDARD H-10 OR H-25 GRATE ee Attached ADS NO BID NO BID NO BID
Letter FROM ADS
See Attached ADS SEE PRICING
" TANDARD H-10 OR H- TE B
> [10" WITH STANDARD H-25 GRA el NO BID NO BID NO BID e
See Attached ADS SEE PRICING
3 12" WITH STANDARD H-10 OR H-25 GRATE SeLLEEe NO BID NO BID NO BID
Letter FROM ADS
See Attached ADS SEE PRICING
15" WITH STANDARD H-10 OR H-25 GRATE NO BID NO Bl NO BID
4 [15" WITH STAND > Letter GED FROM ADS
See Attached AD SEE PRICING
5 18" WITH STANDARD h-10 OR H-25 GRATE ARG ADS NO BID NO BID NO BID
Letter FROM ADS
See Attached AD SEE PRICING
6 |24" WITH STANDARD H-10 OR H-25 GRATE REEALEEN AR NO BID NO BID NO BID
Letter FROM ADS
See Attached ADS SEE PRICING
7 |30" WITH STANDARD H-10 OR H-25 GRATE SRS NO BID NO BID NO BID
Letter FROM ADS
[H-25 GRATE
See Attached ADS SEE PRICING
8  |4" WITH STANDARD H-10 OR H-25 GRATE NO BID NO BID NO BID
4 > Letter FROM ADS
See Attached ADS SEE PRICING
10" WITH STANDARD H-10 OR H-25 GRATE NO BID Bl NO BID
3 DARD 3 Letter NOBID FROM ADS
See Attach SEE PRICI
10 [12" WITH STANDARD H-10 OR H-25 GRATE EeAttached ADS NO BID NO BID NO BID NG
Letter FROM ADS
See Attached ADS SEE PRICING
1 |1s" WITH ST H-10 OR H-25 GRATE NO Bl 0Bl
1 |15" WITH STANDARD H-10 OR H-25 — D NO BID NO BID o A
See Attached ADS SEE PRICING
12 |18" WITH STANDARD h-10 OR H-25 GRATE NO BID NO BI NO BID
THSTANDARD . Letter ) OBIb FROM ADS
hed ADS
13 |24" WITH STANDARD H-10 OR H-25 GRATE SRRAtEERUAR NO BID NO BID NO BID i ke
Letter FROM ADS
See Attached ADS SEE PRICING
14 30" WITH STANDARD H-10 OR H-25 GRATE NO BID Bl NO BID
4 [BETWITHSTARDARD 3 Letter NOBID FROM ADS
PARTI
D: PVC SURFACE DRAINAGE PRODUCTS
' PRICE DELIVERED | PRICE DELIVERED PRICE PRICE | R |CE DELIVERED
[tem # | PVC SURFACE DRAINAGE PRODUCTS: s friad DELIVERED | DELIVERED | FoaT
| FOOT | FOOT
10" ROUND DROP-IN GRATE (NON-TRAFFIC | See Attached ADS SEE PRICING
1 NO BID BI NO BID
B TYPE) PROPRIETARY TO ADS HDPE PIPE Letter HOBID FROM ADS
n i i F h
| 12" ROUND DROP-IN GRATE (NON-TRAFFIC |~ See Attached ADS - O O BID SEE PRICING
TYPE) PROPRIETARY TO ADS HDPE PIPE Letter FROM ADS
" DROP- TE (NON-TRAFFIC | See Attach SEE PRIC
, 15" ROUND DROPIN GRATE ( ee Attached ADS NG BID N BID O BID ING
TYPE) PROPRIETARY TO ADS HDPE PIPE Letter FROM ADS
" P-IN GRATE (NON-TRAFFI See Attached ADS IN
, [18"ROUND DROP- ( RAFFIC ee Attached AD NG BID N~ - SEE PRICING
TYPE) PROPRIETARY TO ADS HDPE PIPE Letter FROM ADS
" ROP-IN TRAFFI See Attached EE PRICING
5 24" ROUND D GRATE (NON-TRAFFIC ee Attached ADS NOBID NO BID NO BID S
TYPE) PROPRIETARY TO ADS HDPE PIPE Letter FROM ADS




BID #2023H-9
DRAINAGE PIPE AND STEEL PLATE FOR PIPE
BID TABULATION

PRECISION
. , ADVANCED LANE TOWN & COUNTY
Award made by Section. All ties Awarded CHEMUNG SUPPLY DRAINAGE SYSTEMS | ENTERPRISES PIPE & BRIDGE AND RAIL
base on draw from a hat. CORP PRODUCTS
INC LLC INC
INC
PLASTIC HARTMAN ENDWALL SYSTEM OR
EQ! !BI EQB ]2" ]5" 18" BDID 2 q" lzll!E.
See Attached ADS SEE PRICING
T BI NO BID NO BID
2 Letter b &R 9 FROM ADS
See Attached ADS SEE PRICING
2 agn BI NO Bl NO BID
> Letter NG BID o FROM ADS
See Attached ADS SEE PRICING
18" BI NO BID NO BID
3 Letter NOBID FROM ADS
See Attached ADS SEE PRICING
" BI Bl NO BI
4 Letter NO BIR NG BID B FROM ADS
DRAIN BASINS:
/H-10 GRATE
8" DIAMETER X 60" TALL WITH UP TO TWO
See Attached ADS ' SEE PRI
1 |OUTLETS 4" TO 6" DIAMETER WITH e L:tcteer NO BID NO BID NO BID e /Cxlgsc
STANDARD H-10 GRATE
8" DIAMETER X 60" TALL WITH UP TO TWO
See Attached ADS SEE PRICING
> |OUTLETS 4" TO 8" DIAMETER WITH e thct; NO BID NO BID NO BID e
STANDARD H-10 GRATE
10" DIAMETER X 60" TALL WITH UP TO TWO
See Attached ADS E
3 |OUTLETS 4" TO 8" DIAMETER WITH ee L:tctei NO BID NO BID NO BID SFER(;S\IE\ISSG
STANDARD H-10 GRATE
10" DIAMETER X 60" TALLWITHUPTOTWO | 0 <EE PRICING
4 |OUTLETS 4" TO 10" DIAMETER WITH o NO BID NO BID NO BID o
STANDARD H-10 GRATE
12" DIAMETER X 60" TALL WITH UP TO TWO
See Attached ADS EE
5 |OUTLETS 4" TO 10" DIAMETER WITH ee L:tctei NO BID NO BID NO BID SFRJSI/C\ISSG
STANDARD H-10 GRATE
12" DIAMETER X 60" TALL WITH UP TO TWO
See Attached ADS
6 |OUTLETS 4" TO 12" DIAMETER WITH == L:tct:; D NO BID NO BID NO BID Sf:g;'ggsc
STANDARD H-10 GRATE
15" DIAMETER X 60" TALL WITH UP TO TWO
Attached ADS
7 |OUTLETS 4" TO 12" DIAMETER WITH see tLt:tCt;d b NO BID NO BID NO BID SFE:;;';'I;'SG
STANDARD H-10 GRATE
15" DIAMETER X 60" TALL WITH UP TO TWO
See Attached ADS SEE PRICING
8 |OUTLETS 4" TO 15" DIAMETER WITH == L:tcteer NO BID NO BID NO BID e /C\DS
STANDARD H-10 GRATE -
18" DIAMETER X 60" TALL WITH UP TO TWO
: Attached ADS _
9 |OUTLETS 4" TO 15" DIAMETER WITH see thcteid D NO BID NO BID NO BID SE:(S;';'{;\'SG
STANDARD H-10 GRATE
18" DIAMETER X 60" TALL WITH UP TO TWO
See Attached ADS
10 |OUTLETS 4" TO 18" DIAMETER WITH ee Lz:tei b NO BID NO BID NO BID Sf:g;'/i';;
STANDARD H-10 GRATE




BID #2023H-9
DRAINAGE PIPE AND STEEL PLATE FOR PIPE
BID TABULATION

Award made by Section. All ties Awarded CHEMUNG SUPPLY ADVANCED LANE PR:ISESIB?N TOWN & COUNTY
y : DRAINAGE SYSTEMS | ENTERPRISES BRIDGE AND RAIL
base on draw from a hat. CORP PRODUCTS
INC LLC INC
INC
24" DIAMETER X 60" TALL WITH UP TO TWO
h EEP
1 |OUTLETS 4" TO 18" DIAMETER WITH 3ee Attztcteerd ADS NO BID NO BID NO BID SFRO;];ISSG
STANDARD H-10 GRATE
" ETER X 60" TALL WITH UP TO TW.
24" DI UPTOTWO | coe Attached ADS SEE PRICING
12 |OUTLETS 4" TO 24" DIAMETER WITH i NO BID NO BID NO BID e
STANDARD H-10 GRATE
" ETER X 60" TALL WITH UP TO TW
30" DIAM UPTOTWO | .o Attached ADS SEE PRICING
13 |OUTLETS 4" TO 24" DIAMETER WITH . NO BID NO BID NO BID OV ADS
STANDARD H-10 GRATE
0" DIAMETER X 60" TALL WITH UP TO TWO
3 See Attached ADS SEE PRICING
14 |OUTLETS 4" TO 30" DIAMETER WITH o NO BID NO BID NO BID e
STANDARD H-10 GRATE
/H-25 GRATE
12" DIAMETER X 60" TALL WITH UP TO TWO A
See Attached ADS SEE PRICING
15 |OUTLETS 4" TO 10" DIAMETER WITH ceAttache NO BID NO BID NO BID
Letter FROM ADS
STANDARD H-25 GRATE
n n
2" DIAMETER X 60" TALLWITH UPTOTWO |~~~ N
16 |OUTLETS 4" TO 12" DIAMETER WITH vl NO BID NO BID NO BID O ADS
STANDARD H-25 GRATE
n n
15" DIAMETER X 60" TALLWITH UPTOTWO |~ <EE PRICING
17 |OUTLETS 4" TO 12" DIAMETER WITH o NO BID NO BID NO BID e OM ADS
STANDARD H-25 GRATE
n n
15" DIAMETER X 60" TALLWITH UPTOTWO |~ '~ SEE PRICING
18 |OUTLETS 4" TO 15" DIAMETER WITH i NO BID NO BID NO BID e OMADS
STANDARD H-25 GRATE
n n
18" DIAMETER X 60" TALLWITHUPTOTWO | 0 SEE PRICING
19 |OUTLETS 4" TO 15" DIAMETER WITH NO BID NO BID NO BID
Letter FROM ADS
STANDARD H-25 GRATE
8" DIAMETER X 60" TALL WITH UP TO TWO
W DA See Attached ADS SEE PRICING
20 |OUTLETS 4" TO 18" DIAMETER WITH o NO BID NO BID NO BID e OMADS
STANDARD H-25 GRATE
n n
24" DIAMETER X 60" TALLWITHUPTOTWO | (0 SEE PRICING
21 |OUTLETS 4" TO 18" DIAMETER WITH o NO BID NO BID NO BID e OM ADS
STANDARD H-25 GRATE
" DIAMETER X 60" TALL WITH UP TO TWO
240 B See Attached ADS N SEE PRICING
22 |OUTLETS 4" 70 24" DIAMETER WITH e NO BID NO BID NO BID e OMADS
STANDARD H-25 GRATE
0" DIAMETER X 60" TALL WITH UP TO TWO
> ?)UTLETS "TO 24" DIAMETER WITH RESALERHEdAD S NO BID NO BID NO BID SEHRRCING
3 4 4 Letter FROM ADS
STANDARD H-25 GRATE




BID #2023H-9
DRAINAGE PIPE AND STEEL PLATE FOR PIPE
BID TABULATION

PRECISION
i . ADVANCED LANE TOWN & COUNTY
Award made by Section. All ties Awarded CHEMUNG SUPPLY DRAINAGE SYSTEMS | ENTERPRISES PIPE & BRIDGE AND RAIL
base on draw from a hat. CORP PRODUCTS
INC LLC INC
INC
n n TWO
30" DIAMETER X 60" TALLWITH UP TO SeaAokachad ADS SEE PRICING
24 |OUTLETS 4" TO 30" DIAMETER WITH Letter NO BID NO BID NO BID FROM ADS
STANDARD H-25 GRATE
COMMENTS: **Chemung Supply / Town &
County Bridge and Rail Inc - No Pricing
provided see letter Just See ADS Letter
COMMENTS:

DEVIATIONS: PRECISION PIPE NOTED AND EXPLAINED

ALL DATA IS PRELIMINARY AND DOCUMENTED AT THE TIME OF BID OPENING, SUBJECT

TO ERRORS OR OMJSSIONS. ~[[-,H.‘S’DATA SHOULD NOT BE INTERPRETED AS CONFIRMATION

OF BID RESULTS wLE‘S(S;STG'NED BY THE JEFFERSON COUNTY PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

THIS BID TABULATION DQES NOT.IMPLY AN AWARD HAS BEEN MADE UNLESS NOTED.

—t/ ) 7
/ P ——— e —

—=e

7

B

DATE

4 PURCHASING DEPT



