County of Jefferson

Office of the Purchasing Department Historic Court House 195 Arsenal Street Watertown, New York 13601-2565

Phone: 315-785-3077 Fax: 315-785-7591

Buyers Karin Dorr Amanda McCracken



<u>Director</u> Mark Sachetti, CPPB Email Addresses:
marks@co.jefferson.ny.us
karind@co.jefferson.ny.us
amccracken@co.jefferson.ny.us
avisg@co.jefferson.ny.us
mshear@co.jefferson.ny.us

Senior Account Clerk Avis Gilmore

Account Clerk
Mary Ann Shear

NOTICE OF AWARD

APRIL 24, 2023

ATTN ROB SARTWELL MCQUADE & BANNIGAN INC 1300 STARK STREET UTICA NY 13502

BID #2023H-5

NAME: WOODEN GRADE STAKES

CONTRACT PERIOD: MAY 1, 2023 THROUGH APRIL 30, 2025

Dear Mr. Sartwell:

I am pleased to inform you that your Bid submitted for the solicitation referenced has been accepted based on full compliance with the specifications, terms and conditions included in the Bid.

Submittal Requirements have been met. The following documents are enclosed or pending:

Purchase Order / To be issued

If you have any questions regarding this notice of award please call the Jefferson County Purchasing Department.

Sincerely,

Mark Sachetti, Purchasing Director

MS/kd

C: Department, Auditor, Bid File, White Cap

BID #2023H-5 WOODEN GRADE STAKES BID TABULATION

			2023-2025 BID PRICING		
•			2025 2025 DID 1 NICING		
	, 1		MCQUADE & BANNIGAN	WHITE CAP	
ITEM#	Approx Qty*	Size	Unit Bid	Unit Bid	
250	2,500	1" x 1" x 36"	\$0.65	\$1.00	
		TOTAL	\$1,625.00	\$2,500.00	
251	5,000	1" x 1" x 48"	\$0.81	\$1.11	
		TOTAL	\$4,050.00	\$5,550.00	
252	2,500	1" x 2" x 48"	\$1.66	NO BID	
		TOTAL	\$4,150.00		
253	200	2" x 2" x 24"	\$2.37	\$2.45	
		TOTAL	\$474.00	\$490.00	
HARDWOOD SIGN WEDGES					
ITEM#					
	Approx Qty*	Size	Unit bid		
254	Approx Qty* 500 pair	Size 4" x 4" x 16" 14° wedge	Unit bid \$4.65	NO BID	
254		4" x 4" x 16"		NO BID	
254		4" x 4" x 16" 14° wedge	\$4.65	NO BID	
254		4" x 4" x 16" 14° wedge TOTAL	\$4.65 \$2,325.00	NO BID	
	500 pair	4" x 4" x 16" 14° wedge TOTAL GRAND TOTAL	\$4.65 \$2,325.00 \$2,799.00	NO BID	
ALL DATA IS PRELIM	500 pair	4" x 4" x 16" 14° wedge TOTAL GRAND TOTAL UMENTED AT THE T	\$4.65 \$2,325.00 \$2,799.00 FIME OF BID OPENING,	NO BID	
ALL DATA IS PRELIM UBJECT TO ERRORS	500 pair 500 pair INARY AND DOC OR OMISSIONS	4" x 4" x 16" 14° wedge TOTAL GRAND TOTAL UMENTED AT THE T	\$4.65 \$2,325.00 \$2,799.00 FIME OF BID OPENING, D NOT BE INTERPRETED	NO BID	
LL DATA IS PRELIM UBJECT TO ERRORS S CONFIRMATION C	500 pair INARY AND DOC OR OMISSIONS OF BID RESULTS	4" x 4" x 16" 14° wedge TOTAL GRAND TOTAL UMENTED AT THE T THIS DATA SHOUL UNLESS SIGNED BY	\$4.65 \$2,325.00 \$2,799.00 FIME OF BID OPENING, D NOT BE INTERPRETED THE JEFFERSON COUNTY	NO BID	
ALL DATA IS PRELIM SUBJECT TO ERRORS AS CONFIRMATION OP PURCHASING DEPAR	500 pair INARY AND DOC OR OMISSIONS OF BID RESULTS OF BID RESULTS OF BID	4" x 4" x 16" 14° wedge TOTAL GRAND TOTAL UMENTED AT THE T THIS DATA SHOUL UNLESS SIGNED BY	\$4.65 \$2,325.00 \$2,799.00 FIME OF BID OPENING, D NOT BE INTERPRETED	NO BID	
ALL DATA IS PRELIM SUBJECT TO ERRORS AS CONFIRMATION OF PURCHASING DEPAR	500 pair INARY AND DOC OR OMISSIONS OF BID RESULTS OF BID RESULTS OF BID	4" x 4" x 16" 14° wedge TOTAL GRAND TOTAL UMENTED AT THE T THIS DATA SHOUL UNLESS SIGNED BY	\$4.65 \$2,325.00 \$2,799.00 FIME OF BID OPENING, D NOT BE INTERPRETED THE JEFFERSON COUNTY	NO BID	
ALL DATA IS PRELIM SUBJECT TO ERRORS AS CONFIRMATION C	500 pair INARY AND DOC OR OMISSIONS OF BID RESULTS OF BID RESULTS OF BID	4" x 4" x 16" 14° wedge TOTAL GRAND TOTAL UMENTED AT THE T THIS DATA SHOUL UNLESS SIGNED BY	\$4.65 \$2,325.00 \$2,799.00 FIME OF BID OPENING, D NOT BE INTERPRETED THE JEFFERSON COUNTY	NO BID	
ALL DATA IS PRELIM SUBJECT TO ERRORS AS CONFIRMATION OP PURCHASING DEPAR	500 pair INARY AND DOC OR OMISSIONS OF BID RESULTS OF BID RESULTS OF BID	4" x 4" x 16" 14° wedge TOTAL GRAND TOTAL UMENTED AT THE T THIS DATA SHOUL UNLESS SIGNED BY	\$4.65 \$2,325.00 \$2,799.00 FIME OF BID OPENING, D NOT BE INTERPRETED THE JEFFERSON COUNTY	NO BID	