County of Jefferson

" Office of the Purchasing Department
Historic Court House
195 Arsenal Street
Watertown, New York 13601-2565
Phone: 315-785-3077
Fax: 315-785-7591

Buyers
Karin Dorr
Amanda McCracken

Director
Mark Sachetti, CPPB

Email Addresses:
marks@co.jefferson.ny.us
karind@co.jefferson.ny.us

amccracken@co.jefferson.ny.us
avisg@co.jefferson.ny.us
‘mshear@co.jefferson.ny.us

Senior Account Clerk
Avis Gilmore

Account Clerk
Mary Ann Shear

APRIL 24, 2023

MRkBRIAN IiEEPER REGIONAL SALES MANGER

NOTICE OF AWARD

MR TIM MCNALLY SENIOR ESTIMATOR

SUIT-KOTE CORPORATION MIDLAND ASPHALT MATERIALS INC
1911 LORINGS CROSSING ROAD 640 YOUNG STREET

CORTLAND NY 13045 TONAWANDA NY 14150

MR JAMES O’BRIEN JR

BOTHAR CONSTRUCTION LLC

170 EAST SERVICE ROAD

BINGHAMTON NY 13901

BID #2023H-3d NAME: CRACK AND JOINT FILLER

CONTRACT PERIOD:  MAY 1, 2023 THROUGH APRIL 30, 2025

AWARD: BASED ON LOW BID PER TABULATION

Dear Mr. Pepper, Mr. McNally, Mr. O'Brien:

I am pleased to inform you that your Bid submitted for the solicitation referenced has been accepted based on
full compliance with the specifications, terms and conditions included in the Bid.

Submittal Requirements have been met. The following documents are enclosed or pending:

Purchase Order [ To be issued

If you have any questions regarding this notice of award please call the Jefferson County Purchasing> Department;

Sincerely,

%ylwwu

Mark Sachetti, Purchasing Dlrector
Ms/kd

Enclosure: Wage Rates

C:  Department, Auditor, Bid File, Vestal Asphalt

SHARED/BIDS/HIGHWAY BID BOOK/AWARD 2023H-3d MIDLAND, SUIT-KOTE & BOTHAR



BID #2023H-3d
CRACK JOINT FILLER

D6690, Plastic Joint Material (Select Pound or Gallon)

BID TABULATION
. MIDLAND ASPHALT
BOTHAR CONSTRUCTIONY * MATERIALS, INC. SUIT-KOTE CORP. VESTAL ASPH/ALT
DESCRIPTION. PRICE PER GALLON PRICE PER GALLON PRICE PER GALLON PRICE PER GALLON

a. Fiber Reinforced Crack Filler Material
Quantity: PG64-22 + Fiber
0 to 300 gallons $31.47 $26.67 : % $48.69
301 to 600 gallons $22.02 $24.51 o $26.69
601+ gallons $18.94 $23.43 $20.31
b. _Plastic Joint Material D6690, Type Ii
0 to 300 gallons 7.6 $20.87 §50.05°
301 to 600 gallons . $24.87 $25.78 $28.05
601 + gallons g%% $23.79 $21.47 $21.68
¢._Multigrade Asph Cement Crack-filler
0 to 300 gallons ' NO BID NO BID - NO BID
301t0 600 gallons NO BID NO BID NOBID
601 + gallons NOBID NO BID " NO BI_D
Material Supplied

"NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

COMMENTS:

ALL DATA IS PRELIMINARY AND DOCUMENTED AT THE TIME OF BID OPENING,

SUBJECT TO ERRORS OR-OMISSIONS. THIS DATA SHOULD NOT BE INTERPRETED AS CONFIRMATION

OF BID RESULA'S UNFESS SIGNED BY THE JEFFERSON COUNTY PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

TH% %l% TﬁUlﬁTIOE:ggfs,NQIIMPLY AN AWARD HAS BEEN MADE UNLESS NOTED.

7N ———

3/14/2023

/ )} PURCHASING DEPT

DATE




