County of Jefferson
Office of the Purchasing Department
Historic Court House

195 Arsenal Street

Watertown, New York 13601-2565
Phone: 315-785-3077

Fax: 315-785-7591

Email Addresses:
marks@-co.jefferson.ny.us
karind@co.jefferson.ny.us

amccracken@co.jefferson.ny.us
avisg@co.jefferson.ny.us
mshear@co.jefferson.ny.us

Senior Account Clerk
Avis Gilmore

Buyers Director
Karin Dorr Mark Sachetti, CPPB Account Clerk
Amanda McCracken
Mary Ann Shear
NOTICE OF AWARD

APRIL 24, 2023

ATTN BRIAN MCDONALD
HAUN WELDING SUPPLY
22495 FISHER RD
WATERTOWN NY 13601

BID #2023H-25

ATTN DAVID LESPERANCE
HANES SUPPLY INC

22432 US ROUTE 11
WATERTOWN NY 13601

NAME: WELDING GASES AND SUPPLIES

AWARD: BASED ON LOW BID PER TABULATION

CONTRACT PERIOD: MAY 1, 2023 THROUGH APRIL 30, 2025

Dear Mr. McDonald & Mr. Lesperance:

| am pleased to inform you that your Bid submitted for the solicitation referenced has been accepted based on full

compliance with the specifications, terms and conditions included in the Bid.

Submittal Requirements have been met. The following documents are enclosed or pending:

V Purchase Order to be Issued

If you have any questions regarding this notice of award please call the Jefferson County Purchasing Department.

Sincerely, .

I Nari_So) ety

Mark Sachetti, Purchasing Director

MS/am

C:  Department, Auditor, Bid File

Purchasing/Shared/Bids/Hwy Bid Book/2023-2025/Awards Highway/Award 2023H-25



BID #2023H-25
WELDING GASES AND SUPPLIES
BID TABUATION

2023 - 2025 BID PRICING
WELDING GASES HANES SUPPLY INC
Annual
N f D ipti
Type Gas Size un:\ber @ Cylinder ITEM # escr-lp l.on / Unit Price
Cylinders Unit Bid
Usage
Acetylene, B Tank 40 cu ft 4 5 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Acetylene 140 cu ft 19 44 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Acetylene 300 cu ft 0 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Acetylene 75 cu ft 5 3 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Argon/CO2 Mix 147 cu ft 1 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Argon/CO2 Mix 300 cu ft 2 5 NO BID “NO BID NO BID
Nitrogen 304 cu ft 6 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Oxygen 20 cu ft (] 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Oxygen 8o cu ft 11 8 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Oxygen 120 cu ft 19 77 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Oxygen 200 cu ft 2 18 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Oxygen 251 cu ft 2 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Total on hand 71 NO BID
Cylinders required on monthly inventory.
Cylinders leased by Jefferson County Highway Department. Please quote price to fill the cylinders listed below:
On Hand

2 each Argon NO BID

3 each |[Argon Mix NO BID

1each Helium NO BID

1each CO2 NO BID
COMMENTS: * Total done by Jefferson County [
DEVIATIONS: NO NO

1

ALL DATA IS PRELIMINARY AND DOCUMEN"TED AT THE TIME OF BID OPENING, SUBJECT TO ERRORS OR OMISSIONS. }

THIS DATA SHOULD NOT BE INTERPRETED AS CONFIRMATION OF BID RESULTS UNLESS SIGNED BY THE JEFFERSON COUNTY PURCHASING DEPARTMENT.

THIS BID TABULATION-DOES NOT IMPLY AN AWARD HAS BEEN MADE}UNLESS NOTED. - ‘ “
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BID #2023H-25
WELDING SUPPLIES
BID TABULATION

2023 - 2025 BID PRICING

HAUN WELDING

HANES SUPPLY INC

ITEM # ITEM DESCRIPTION ITEM # Rezcription Unit Price mEma  |Pescription/Unitl o price
Unit Bid Bid

WS-01 .023 MIG WIRE 11 LB, SPOOL 610-E70S615 LB $5.80 SPOOL $48.23
WS-02 .030 MIG WIRE 11 LB. SPOOL 610-E70S6E5 LB $3.15 SPOOL $6.51
WS-03  |.035 MIG WIRE 33 LB, SPOOL 610-ED03144 LB $4.46 NO BID NO BID
WS-04 HARD FACING WIRE .045 LC 55 25 LB. LINCOLN LB $11.23 NO BID NO BID
WS-05 1/2” FLUSH NOZZLE FOR 250 MST GUN NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
WS-06 5/8”STD.FLUSH NOZZLE FOR 250 MST GUN NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
WS-07 50 LBS. 6010 1/8” WELDING ELECTRODE LINCOLN LB $4.86 NO BID NO BID
WS-08 50 LBS. 6010 3/32” WELDING ELECTRODE LINCOLN LB $5.22 NO BID NO BID
WSs-09 50 LBS. 6010 5/32" WELDING ELECTRODE LINCOLN LB $4.77 NO BID NO BID
WS-10 50 LBS.6013 1/8” WELDING ELECTRODE EDo010153 LB $4.68 NO BID NO BID
WS-11 50 LBS. 6013 3/32” WELDING ELECTRODE ED010161 LB $4.95 NO BID NO BID
WS-12 50 LBS. 6013 5/32” WELDING ELECTRODE ED010165 LB $4.61 NO BID NO BID
WS-13 10 LB. CAN 1/8"” 308L-16 SS ELECTRODE ED033090 LB $9.13 NO BID NO BID
WS-14 2 LB. PKG.1/8" 4055 CAST IRON ELECTRODE LB $73.83 NO BID NO BID
WS-15 2 LB. PKG.1/8"” 4099 CAST IRON ELECTRODE LB $120.00 NO BID NO BID
WS-16 1LB. TUBE 1/8” 5356 ALUM. TIG WIRE 53566011POP LB $15.18 NO BID NO BID
WS-17  |1LB. TUBE 3/32” 5356 ALUM. TIG WIRE 53565011POP. LB $15.82 NO BID NO BID
WS-18 1LB. TUBE 1/8"” 4043 ALUM. TIG WIRE 40436011POP LB $10.50 NO BID NO BID
WS-19 1LB. TUBE 3/32” 4043 ALUM. TIG WIRE 40435011POP LB $10.75 NO BID NO BID
WS-20 50 LBS. 6011 1/8” WELDING ELECTRODE ED028153 LB $4.69 NO BID NO BID
WS-21 50 LBS. 6011 5/32” WELDING ELECTRODE ED028154 LB $4.61 NO BID NO BID
WSs-22 |50 LBS. 7014 1/8” WELDING ELECTRODE ED010183 LB $4.59 NO BID NO BID
WS-23 50 LBS.7014 3/32” WELDING ELECTRODE EDo010189 LB $4.88 NO BID NO BID
WS-24 50 LBS. 7018 1/8” WELDING ELECTRODE ED028281 LB $3.74 NO BID NO BID
WS-25 50 LBS. 7018 3/32"” WELDING ELECTRODE ED028280 LB $3.93 NO BID NO BID
WS-26 50 LBS. 7018 5/32” WELDING ELECTRODE ED028282 LB $3.47 NO BID NO BID
WS-27 |50 LBS. 7018 3/16” WELDING ELECTRODE ED028283 LB $3.84 NO BID NO BID
WS-28 GRINDING WHEEL 4.5” X 5/8-11 HUB NO BID NO BID #ABR20018 EA $3.80
WS-29 GRINDING WHEEL 4.5” X 7/8” HUB 810-20060 EA $2.40 #ABR20017 EA $2.55
WS-30 GRINDING WHEEL 7” X 5/8-11 HUB NO BID NO BID #ABR20073 EA $6.90
WS-31 GRINDING WHEEL 7”7 X 7/8” HUB 810-20080 EA $5.20 #ABR20045 EA $6.25
WS-32 ZIP WHEELS 3” X 5/16” CENTER NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
WS-33 ZIP WHEELS 3” X 3/8” CENTER 810-23050 EA $185.00 #ABR66125 EA $1.85
WS-34  |ZIP WHEELS 4.5”X 7/8” CENTER 810-23101 EA $2.30 #ABR63081 EA $2.30
WS-35  |OXY/ACET HOSE 1/4” X 25' R GRADE 290-RH-2102 EA $29.60 EA $39.76
WS-36 OXY/ACET HOSE 1/4” X 50' R GRADE 290-RH-2103 EA $46.80 EA $52.75
WS-37 OXY/ACET HOSE 1/4” X 100' R GRADE 290-RH-2105 EA $91.00 EA $96.71
WS-38 Grade T Propane hose 1/4” X 25' 290-TH-1731 EA $45.60 EA $73.40
WS-39 Grade T Propane hose 1/4” X 50’ 290-TH-1741 EA $79.00 EA $118.75
WS-40 |Grade T Propane hose 1/4”” X 100' 290-TH-1751 EA $165.00 EA $196.87
WS-41 WESTERN QUICK DISCONNECTS QDB20 EA $54.85 NO BID NO BID
WS-42  |WESTERN QUICK DISCONNECTS QDB30 EA $54.85 EA $79.51
WS-43  [Lightning Bug or equal Flint less torch igniter 290-BUG EA $13.40 NO BID NO BID
WS-44 SINGLE FLINT TORCH STRIKERS 290-WM3001 EA $2.25 WEL20000 EA $4.00
WS-45 SINGLE FLINTS 5/PKG. 290-WM3001X EA $1.68 WEL20010 EA $2.00
WS-46 TORCH TIP CLEANERS 290-WYPOL EA $2.69 NO BID NO BID
WS-47 OUTSIDE COVER LENS FOR SG 9000 SERIES HELMET NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
WS-48 INSIDE COVER LENS FOR SG 9000 SERIES HELMET NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
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BID #2023H-25
WELDING SUPPLIES
BID TABULATION

2023 - 2025 BID PRICING

HAUN WELDING

HANES SUPPLY INC

ITEM # ITEM DESCRIPTION ITEM # Descrlptony/ Unit Price Mg [Pescription /Uit price
Unit Bid Bid
WS-49 PP-2 CR-39 COVER LENS 930-PP-2 EA $0.68 EA $0.97
WS-50 PP-4 CR-39 COVER LENS 930-PP-4 EA $1.75 EA $2.65
WS-51 PUROX 4202-5 TORCH TIP 202-P4202-5 EA $12.00 EA $16.85
WS-52 PUROX 4202-7 TORCH TIP 202-P4202-7 EA $12.00 EA $16.85
WS-53 AIRCO 144-3 TORCH TIP 202-A144-3 EA $12.00 EA $21.46
WS-54  |CONTACT TIPS .023 ESAB 20543 EA $6.00 NO BID NO BID
WS-55  [CONTACT TIPS .030 ESAB 996996 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
WS-56  |CONTACT TIPS .035 ESAB 996996 EA $1.15 NO BID NO BID
WS-57 BOX OF 144 ROUND SOAP STONE 870-FLATSSEE EA $0.11 EA $30.00
WS-58 WH10 CHIPPING HAMMER 390-LH-1 EA $10.60 NO BID NO BID
WS-59 170-S HEADGEAR 930-29077 EA $16.80 EA $17.75
WS-60  (CLEAR FACE SHIELD 930-BG1 EA $14.25 EA $2.11
WS-61 MILLER TITANIUM WELDING HELMET 256177 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
WS-62 930-06-0100-20SW SPEED GLAS HELMET NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
WS-63  |2519Y WELDING GLOVES 73-7018H/L PAIR $13.21 EA $11.50
WS-64 MULTIMASTER 260 MIG GUN OEM NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
WS-65 GBP-11 PRESSURE GAUGE 202-GA138-03 EA $18.25 NO BID NO BID
WS-66  [GBP-13 PRESSURE GAUGE 202-GA143--03 EA 18..25 NO BID NO BID
WS-67 GBP-15 PRESSURE GAUGE 202-GA134.03 EA $18.25 NO BID NO BID
WS-68 GBP-9 PRESSURE GAUGE 202-GA139.03 EA $24.60 NO BID NO BID
WS-69  [Harris CGA 540 or equal Oxagen Regulator 200-3000681 EA $97.00 NO BID NO BID
WS-70  |Harris CGA 300 or equal Acetylene Regulator 200-3000683 EA $97.00 NO BID NO BID
WS-71 GREEN WELDING JACKET MED. 910-7040/M EA $19.38 WEL30040 EA $21,.00
WS-72  |GREEN WELDING JACKET LG. 910-7040/L EA $19.38 WEL30060 EA $21.00
WS-73 GREEN WELDING JACKET XL 910-7040/XL EA $19.38 WEL30080 EA $21.00
WS-74  |GREEN WELDING JACKET 2XL 910-7040/2XL EA $19.38 WEL30085 EA $21.00
WS-75 DR.GREEN FACE SHIELD 930-29086 EA $14.00 NO BID NO BID
WS-76 TIG GLOVES LG. 910-1600-5 PAIR $11.00 PRO74000 EA $11.50
WSs-77 TIG GLOVES XL 910-1600-6 PAIR $11.00 75-320/XL EA $11.50
WS-78 WELDING BEANIES ELASTIC 910-BAENIE-E EA $1.80 WEL40005 EA $7.80
WS-79 PUROX ELITE FLAMEMASTER KIT OBSOLETE NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Ws-80 PLASMA ELECTRODES ICE-80T NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
WS-81 PLASMA DRAG SHIELD NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
WS-82 PLASMATIP STD ICE-60T,80T NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
WS-83 SLUGGER CUTTER 7/16” X 1” EA $21.00 EA $26.60
WS-84  [SLUGGER CUTTER 1/2” X 1” EA $21.45 EA $27.50
WS-85 SLUGGER CUTTER 9/16” X 1"’ EA $21.80 EA $33.50
WS-86  [SLUGGER CUTTER 5/8” X1” EA $21.80 EA $30.00
WS-87  |SLUGGER CUTTER 11/16” X 1” EA $24.55 EA $32.00
WS-88 SLUGGER CUTTER 3/4” X1” EA $24.55 EA $36.00
WS-89 SLUGGER CUTTER 13/16" X 1” EA $26.70 EA $40.00
WS-90  [SLUGGER CUTTER 7/8” X 1” CC875 EA $27.28 EA $42.00
WS-91 SLUGGER CUTTER 15/16” X 1" CC937 EA $29.41 EA $46.00
WS-92 SLUGGER CUTTER 1” X 1” CC200 EA $30.88 EA $50.00
WS-93  |SLUGGER CUTTER 11/16” X 1 CC106 EA $33.65 EA $52.00
WS-94  [SLUGGER CUTTER11/8” X 1" CCi12 EA $36.00 EA $58.00
WS-95  |SLUGGER CUTTER 13/16” X1” ccng EA $39.41 EA $62.00
WS-96  |SLUGGER CUTTER 11/4” X1” CC125 EA $44.00 EA $64.00
WS-97 SLUGGER CUTTER 7/16” X 2" CC37L EA $29.75 EA $34.00
WS-98 SLUGGER CUTTER 1/2” X 2” CCso0L EA $29.75 EA $37.00
WS-99 SLUGGER CUTTER 9/16” X 2" CC562L EA $29.75 EA $42.00
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BID #2023H-25
WELDING SUPPLIES
BID TABULATION

2023 - 2025 BID PRICING

HAUN WELDING

HANES SUPPLY INC

ITEM # ITEM DESCRIPTION ITEM # Descrption/ Unit Price Emg  |Description/Unitl b price
Unit Bid Bid
WS-100 |SLUGGER CUTTER 5/8” X 2” CC625L EA $29.75 EA $46.00
WS-101 SLUGGER CUTTER 9/16” X 2” CC562L EA $29.75 EA $42.00
WS-102  |SLUGGER CUTTER 5/8” X 2” CC625L EA $29.75 EA $46.00
WS-103  |SLUGGER CUTTER 11/16” X 2” CC687L EA $30.80 EA $50.00
WS-104 [SLUGGER CUTTER 3/4” X 2” CC750L EA $30.80 EA $52.00
WS-105 |SLUGGER CUTTER 13/16” X 2” CC7812L EA $35.77 EA $60.00
WS-106  |SLUGGER CUTTER 7/8” X 2” CC875L EA $37.95 EA $62.00
WS-107  |SLUGGER CUTTER 15/16" X 2" CCo37L EA $39.75 EA $67.00
WS-108  [SLUGGER CUTTER 1” X 2” CCiooL EA $44.00 EA $72.00
WS-109 |[SLUGGER CUTTER 11/16” X 2” CCio6L EA $50.60 EA $76.00
WS-110  |SLUGGER CUTTER 11/8” X 2” CCiz2l EA $53.00 EA $80.00
WS-111 SLUGGER CUTTER 13/16” X 2” CC18L EA $62.00 EA $86.00
WS-112 SLUGGER CUTTER 11/4” X 2” CCi25L EA $62.00 EA $88.00
WS-113 SLUGGER CUTTER 1" centering Pin NO BID NO BID EA $8.00
WS-114  |SLUGGER CUTTER 2" centering Pin NO BID NO BID EA $8.00
% Discount from MSRP for related items: 20% 5%
Labor/Hour to repair welding related equipment: $115/HR N/A
DEVIATIONS ;

/

ALL DATA IS PRELIMINARY AND DOCUMENTED»AT THE TIME OF BID OPENING, SUBJECT TO ERRORS OR OMISSIONS.

THIS DATA SHOULD NOT BE INTERPRETEDAS coﬁFiaMA\TLON OF BID RESULTS UNLESS SIGNED BY THE JEFFERSON COUNTY PURCHASING DEPARTMENT.
THIS BID TABULATION DOE;'"NOT.JMPLY AN AWARD HAS BEEN’M‘.’-}B&UNLES,s NOTED.
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