County of Jefferson
Office of the Purchasing Department
Historic Court House

195 Arsenal Street

Watertown, New York 13601-2565
Phone: 315-785-3077

Fax: 315-785-7591

Buyers ’ ' : Director
Karin Dorr Mark Sachetti, CPPB

Amanda McCrac_ken

- Email Addresses:
marks{@co.jefferson.ny.us
karind@co.jefferson.ny.us

amccracken(@co.jefferson.ny.us
" avisg@co.jefferson.ny.us
mshear@co.jefferson.ny.us

Senior Account Clerk
Avis Gilmore

Account Clerk
Mary Ann Shear

NOTICE OF AWARD

APRIL 24, 2023

ATTN MARK W THOMPSON
JEFFERSON CONCRETE CORP.
22850 COUNTY ROUTE 51
WATERTOWN NY 13601

BID #2023H-17a NAME: PRECAST CONCRETE DECKING PANELS

CONTRACT PERIOD: MAY 1, 2023 THROUGH APRIL 30, 2025

Dear Mr. Thompson,

| am pleased to inform you that your Bid submitted for the solicitation referenced has been accepted based on full

compliance with the specifications, terms and conditions included in the Bid.

The following documents are required before a Contract/Purchase Order is issued:

vV W-g Tax Form and Vendor Information Form (Attached)

If you have any questions regarding this notice of award please call the Jefferson County Purchasing Department.

Sincerely,

“Mase Sicrver,

Mark Sachettl Purchasing Director
MS/kd

C: Department, Auditor, Bid File

SHARED/BIDS/HIGHWAY BID BOOK/AWARD 2023H-17a



BID #2023H-17a
PRECAST CONCRETE DECKING PANELS
BID TABULATION

2023-2025 BID PRICING
JEFFERSON CONCRETE CORP.

3' Panel .

Length (FT) 8 10 12 14 16 18 20 22 24 26 28 30 32 34 36 38 40
Straight $722.00 $623.00 $548.00 $554.00 $507.00 $448.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID’
skewed $722.00 $623.00 | $548.00 | $554.00 mmou.,oo $448.00 NO BiD NO BID NO BID NOBID | NOBID NO BID NOBID | NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID

4' Panel v

Length (FT) 8 10 2 14 16 18 20 22 24 26 28 30 32 34 36 38 40
Straight $929.00 | $800.00 | $701.00 | $665.00 | $563.00 | $565.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID, NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Skewed $929.00 | $800.00 | $701.00 | $665.00 | $563.00 | $565.00 | NOBID | NOBID { NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | NOBID

Prest 1C te P UB / Beari (elast ic)

3' _um:m_ . .

Length (FT) 8 10 12 14 16 18 _20 22 24 26 28 ‘ 30 32 34 36 38 40
Straight NO BID NOBID.| NOBID NOBID NO BID NOBID | $452.00 | $415.00 $411.00 $391.00 | $395.00 | $381.00 | $357.00 | $341.00 | $329.00 | $317.00 | $357.00
Skewed NO BID N© BID NO BID NOBID NO BID NOBID | $452.00 | $415.00 m»:.oo $391.00 | $395.00 | $381.00 | $357.00 | $341.00 | $329.00 | $317.00 | $357.00
3' Panel .

Length (FT) 42 44 46 48 50 52 54 56 58 60 62 64 66 68 70 72 74
Straight $357.00 $348.00 | $336.00 | $329.00 | $346.00 | $337.00 | $330.00 | $321.00 $328.00 | $404.00 | $393.00 | 3%394.00 | $385.00 | $370.00 | $383.00 | $376.00 | $368.00
Skewed $357.00 $348.00 | $336.00 | $329.00 wwam.oo $337.00 .&wo.oo $321.00 $328.00 | $404.00 | $393.00 | $394.00 | $385.00 | $370.00 | $383.00 | $376.00 | $368.00

. 3' Panel -

Length (FT) 76 78 80 - 82 84 v 86 88 90 92 v 94 96 98 100 102 104
Straight $370.00 $369.00 | $380.00 | $382.00 $372.00 $375.00 $378.00 $375.00 $373.00 |-$368.00 | $364.00 | $359.00 $355.00, | $355.00 | $350.00
Skewed $370.00 | $369.00 | $380.00 mwm.w.oo $372.00 | $375.00 | $378.00 | $375.00 $373.00 | $368.00 | $364.00 mwmo,.oo $355.00 | $355.00 | $350.00
4' Panel

Length (FT) 8 10 12 14 16 : 18 20 22 24 26 28 30 32 34 36 38 40
Straight NOBID NOBID | NOBID NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | $536.00 | $492.00 | $370.00 | $369.00 | $380.00 | $382.00 | $372.00 | $375.00 | $378.00 | $375.00 | $373.00
Skewed NoBID | NOBID NOBID | NOBID NO BID NOBID | $536.00 $492.00 | $370.00 | $369.00 | $380.00 | $382.00 $372.00 $375.00 | $378.00 | $375.00 $373.00
4' Panel

Length (FT)’ 42 44 46 48 50 52 54 56 58 60 62 64 66 68 70 72 74
Straight $432.00 $420.00 $407.00 $398.00 $415.00 $405.00 | $396.00 | $386.00 | $384.00 $442.00 | $444.00 | $448.00 | $437.00 $438.00 | $438.00 $429.00 $422.00
Skewed $432.00 | $420.00 | $407.00 | $398.00 | $415.00 $405.00 | $396.00 | $386.00 | $384.00 | $442.00 | $444.00 .| $448.00 | $437.00 $438.00 | $438.00 | $429.00 | $422.00




, BID #2023H-17a
PRECAST CONCRETE DECKING PANELS
BID TABULATION

4' Panel ] ) ) .

Length (FT) ® 76 78 80 82 84 86 . 88 90 92 94 96 98 100 102 104

Straight $422.00 $421.00 $432.00 $437.00 $426.00 $429.00 $433.00 | $428.00 | $426.00 $422.00 | $417.00 NOBID-§ NOBID NOBID | NOBID

Skewed $422.00 $421.00 $432.00 $437.00 $426.00 | $429.00 $433.00 $428.00 $426.00 $422.00 $417.00 NOBID | 'NOBID NOBID NO BID

Comments:
) DOCUMENTED AT THE TIME OF BID OPENING, .
y DATA m_._@c_.o NOT BE _qu_wﬁmg.mo AS CONFIRMATION
THE JEFFERSON nomz\§ RCHASING DEPARTMENT

o

3{21/2023
4 PURCHASING DEPT DATE




