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County of Jefferson
Office of the Purchasing Department
Historic Court House

195 Arsenal Street

Watertown, New York 13601-2565
Phone: 315-785-3077

Fax: 315-785-7591 ‘ ‘ Senior Account Clerk
: e Avis Gilmore

Buyers Director

Karin Dorr , ’ Mark Sachetti, CPPB Account Clerk

Amanda McCracken
Mary Ann Shear

NOTICE OF AWARD
APRIL 24, 2023 :

ATTN MARK W THOMPSON

JEFFERSON CONCRETE CORP.

22850 COUNTY ROUTE 51

WATERTOWN NY 13601

BID #2023H-17 NAME: PRECAST CONCRETE BRIDGE SYSTEM
CONTRACT PERIOD: MAY 1, 2023 THROUGH APRIL 30, 2025

Dear Mr. Thompson,

I am pleased to inform you that your Bid submitted for the solicitation referenced has been accepted based on full
. compliance with the specifications, terms and conditions included in the Bid.

The following documents are required before a Contract/Purchase Order is issued:
" V' W-g Tax Form and Vendor Information Form (Attached) '

If you have any questions regarding this notice of award please call the Jefferson County 'Purchasing Department.

Sincerely,
Mark Sachetti, Purchasing Director ‘

MS/kd

C: Department, Auditor, Bid File

SHARED/BIDS/HIGHWAY BID BOOK/AWARD 2023H-17



. BID #2023H-17 _
- PRECAST CONCRETE BRIDGE SYSTEMS
BID TABULATION :

- 2023-2025 BID PRICING

JEFFERSON CONCRETE CORP.

LEG¥* 8! 10" . 12! 14/ 16’ 18' 20'

8! $1,212.00 | $1,362.00 | $1,413.00 | $1,981.00 | $2,041.00 | $2,338.00 | $1,963.00

7' $1,151.00 | $1,330.00 | $1,353.00 | $1,961.00 | $2,022.00 | $2,299.00 | $1,929.00

6' $1,097.00 { $1,292.00 | $1,325.00 | $1,899.00 | $1,966.00 | $2,229.00 | $1,865.00

5! $1,044.00 | $1,257.00 | $1,302.00 | .$1,863.00 | $1,948.00 | $2,207.00 | $1,841.00

4 $1,039.00 | $1,205.00 | $1,266.00 | $1,820.00 | $1,928.00 | $2,154.00 | $1,802.00

3 | $1,007.00 | $1,205.00 | $1,248.00 '$1,789.oo $1,886.oo $2,125.00 | $1,770.00
LEG* 22! 24! 26' 28! 30' 32! 34 36’

8' $2,794.00 | $2,947.00 | $3,077.00 | $3,082.00 | $3,215.00 | $3,341.00 | $3,526.00 $3,648.00 '
7' $2,701.00 | $2,911.00 | $2,912,00 | $3,034.00 | $3,171.00 | $3,327.00 | $3,436.00 | $3,826.00
6' $2,636.00 | $2,784.00 | $2,847.00 | $2,968.00 | $3,113.00 '$3,2'66.oo $3,542.00 | $3,754.00
5! $2,667.00 | $2,815.00 | $2,788.00 | $2,890.00 | $3,135.00 | $3,375.00 $3,'516.oo $3,746.00
4 $2,580.00 | $2,631.00 | $2,864.00 $3,036.00 | $3,158.00 | $3,352.00 | $3,549.00 | $3,792.00
3! NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID | NOBID | NOBID NO BID NO BID |
*| eg Height to include Units up to 6" shorter or 5-1/2" longer than table value

LEG 8! 10’ 12 14' 16’ 18' 20’

9' $1,432.00 | $1,557.00 | $1,644.00 | $2,146.00 | $2,417.00 | $2,812.00 | $3,188.00 |

8' $1,398.00 | $1,495.00 | $1,599.00 | $2,100.00 | $2,388.00 | $2,782.00 | $3,131.00

7' $1,397.00 | $1,478.00 | $1,593.00 | $1,902.00 | $2,368.00 | $2,733:.00 | $3,105.00

6' $1,368.00 | $1,447.00 | $1,553.00 | $1,876.00 | $2,317.00 | $2,717.00 | $3,065.00

5! $1,335.00 | $1,420.00 | $1,531.00 | $1,819.00 | $2,306.00 | $2,521.00 | $2,909.00

4' $1,313.00 | $1,403.00 | $1,523.00 | $1,796.00 | $2,149.00 | $2,477.00 | $2,859.00 |

3! $1,296.00 | $1,393.00 | $1,492.00 | $1,651.00 | $2,090.00 | $2,436.00 | $2,811.00

WINGWALL UNITS
. PRICE PER _ PRICE PER
HEIGHT {- SLOPE, LENGTH Linear SLOPE | LENGTH Linear
- Foot " Foot

14' 12 23! $910.00 1:3 34 $892.00

12, 1:2 19’ $855.00 1:3 27 $850.00

10" 1:2 15/ $748.00 1:3 21" $782.00

9' 1:2 14' $758.00 1:3 18’ $900.00



~ BID #2023H-17 -
_PRECAST CONCRETE BRIDGE SYSTEMS
BID TABULATION

132

8! 12! $873.00 13 15! $727.00
7' 132 11 $789.00 1:3 14" $652.00
6' 12 9' $814.00 1:3 13.5! $677.00
5' 1:2° 7' $996.00 1:3 10.5' $834.00
4 122 6' $1,026.00 |  1:3 7.5' $912.00
[MODULAR RETAINING WALL SYSTEM
WALL Price Per Linear Foot of Retaining Wall Block
HEIGHT . v
14' NO BID Per Square Foot
13’ NOBID Per Square Foot
12! NO BID Per Square Foot
11 - NQO BID Per Square Foot
10’ NO BID Per Square Foot
9' NO BID Per Square Foot
8! NO BID Per Square Foot
7! NO BID Per Square Foot
6' NO BID “|Per Square Foot
5! NO BID . Per Square Foot
4 NO BID Per Square Foot
3' NO BID Per Square Foot
2! NO BID Per Square Foot
1. NO BID Per Square Foot
HEIGHT (FT)
Base _
Width 4 5! 6! 7' 8! 9! 10!
(FT)
3.5' NOBID | NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
4.5' NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID | NOBID NO BID
5.5' NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
6.5' NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
7.5 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

ALL DATA IS PRELIMINARY AND DOCUMENTED AT THE TIME OF BID OPENING,
SUBJECT TO ERRORS OR OMISSIONS THIS DATA SHOULD NOT BEINTERPRETED AS CONFIRMATION

3/21/2023
DATE




