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Email Addresses:
‘marks@co.jefferson.ny.us

karind@co.jefferson.ny.us

amccracken@co.jefferson.ny.us
avisg@co.jefferson.ny.us
mshear@co.jefferson.ny.us
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Avis Gilmore

Account Clerk
Mary Ann Shear

NOTICE OF AWARD

Apri'l 24,2023

ATTN MARK THOMPSON
JEFFERSON CONCRETE CORP.
22850 COUNTY ROUTE 51
WATERTOWN NY 13601

BID #2023H-16 NAME: CURBING, CONCRETE PIPE AND ‘PREC/AST CONCRETE DRAINAGE UNITS

CONTRACT PERIOD: MAY 1, 2023 THROUGH APRIL 30, 2025

Dear Mr. Thompson:

t am pleased to-inform you that yoUr Bid submitted for the solicitation referenced has been accepted based on full

compliance with the specifications, terms and conditions included in the Bid.

The following documents are required before a Contract/Purchase Order is issued:

v W-9g Tax Form and Vendor Information Form (Attached)

I you have any questions regarding this notice of award, please call the Jefferson County Purchasing Department.

Sincerely, :
Mark Sachett|, Purchasmg Director
MsS/kd

C:  Department, Auditor, Bid File

Purchasing/Shared/Bids/Hwy Bid Book/Awards Highway/Award 2023H-16




BID #2023h-16

CURBING AND PRECAST CONCRETE DRAINAGE UNITS

PARTI
BID TABULATION

2023-2025 BID PRICING

Jefferson Concrete Corp

PART | CURBING FOR PROJECTS AND MAINTENANCE

Per LF

Conventionally formed or machine formed concrete
Item 609-3.04 .
curb and gutter
Class A Concrete as Spec. in Sectio 501 VF-150g, M100G
|Per Foot, First 100LF NO BID
Per Foot, Over 100 LF NO BID
- ' Conventionally formed or machine formed concrete
Item 609-3.04 .
curb
_ {(Types VF-150; or T100) (Type VD-150g) VF150A, M150A,
M100A, M100, M150
Per Foot, First 100LF NO BID
Per Foot, Over100 LF NO BID
Iltem 609.04JC Pinned Add-on Curbing,
_|Per Foot, First 100LF NO BID
Per Foot, Over 100 LF NO BID

Award based upon 800 LF of installation. Actual quantity may vary.




BID #2023h-16
CURBING AND PRECAST CONCRETE DRAINAGE UNITS
BID TABULATION - PART Il

2023-2025 BID PRICING

' JEFFERSON CONCRETE COPRORATION

PART II- PRE.CAST REINFORCED
CONCRETE PIPE

QUANTITY ROUND PIPE / ELLIPTICAL PIPE
EACH SIZE n m HEII HEI HEI
36" 44' " NOBID | NOBID |  29x45 NO BID NO BID NO BID

42" 44" NO BID NO BID 34X53 NO BID NO BID NO BID
48" 50" NO BID NO BID 38X60 NOBID . NO BID NO BID
54" 50’ NO BID NO BID 43X68 NO BID NO BID NOBID |
50" - 50! NO BID NO BID 48X76 ~ NOBID NO BID NO BID
66" 80' NO BID NO BID 53X83 NO BID “NOBID NO BID
72" 80' NO BID NOBID 58X91 NO BID ~ NOBID NO BID
78" 60' NO BID NO BID

NO BID 'NOBID 63X98 NO BID

TOTAL CROSS BID ~ NOBID




BID #2023h-16

CURBING AND PRECAST CONCRETE DRAINAGE UNITS

BID TABULATION - PART llla

2023-2025 BID PRICING
JEFFERSON CONCRETE CORP
PARTlll a DESCRIPTION
PRECAST RECTANGLER DRAINAGE UNITS
: . .| PRECAST
NYSDOT NDSOP INLET DIMENSION A x B RE: ATTACH #1 B;';;IEIISE COVER FRAME GRATE GROSS BID
' PER EACH
5423 - Cast Iron
24" X 24" $156.00 $156.00 $190.00° ‘ $216.00
5636 - Cast Iron
A 36" X 36" $400.00 $400.00 $306.00 | $667.00
: Type - F2 )
Q 34-116" x 36-1/32" $342.00 $342.00 $1,130.00 ' $606.00
. Type-F3
. R 34-1116" x 46-1/16 $389.00 $389.00 $1,426.00 ‘ '$749.00
' Type -1
S 24" x 32-3/32 $258.00 $258.00 $211.00 ‘ $420.00
Type-16
T 26" X 41-15/16" $331.00 $331.00 $281.00 |  $666.00
' T Type -22
U 34-1/16" x 38" $351.00 $351.00 $286.00 $670.00
TOTAL GROSS BID
TRANSVERSE DRAINAGE INTERCEPTOR UNITS, No Bid
INCLUDING GRATE
ONSITE CORE DRILLING $625.00
JERSEY BARRIERS 20' NYSDOT approved No Bid
Left or Right Run Out No Bid




CURBING AND PRECAST CONCRETE DRAINAGE UNITS

BID #2023h-16

PART llib BID TABULATION

2023-2025 BID PRICING

|PART Il b

Jefferson Concrete Corp

PRECAST ROUND DRAINAGE UNITS |

To include Steps, Sealer &
Invert Openings - -

B ' ,

NYSDOT Structural NO. OF BID PRICE - P'ERP\:Q\:_CIE BID PRICE | BID PRICE | BID PRICE
Internal dia (in) UNITS PER EACH RlSE-R. PER EACH | PEREACH | PEREACH
REQUIRED | BASE UNIT UNIT SLAB COVER| RISER 2" RISER 4"

48" 5 $295.00 $124.00 $240.00 - $42.00 $84.00

60" 5 $500.00 $194.00 $436.00 $42.00 $84.00

72" 5 ${83o.od $300.00 $722.00 $42.00 $84.00

84" 5 NO BID NO BID NOBID $42.00 $84.00

96" 5 $2,082.00 $645.00 $1,782.00 $42.oo\ $84.00
Concrete “Concrete

Grade Rings | Grade Rings

2" and 4"

2" and 4"




BID #2023h-16

CURBING AND PRECAST CONCRETE DRAINAGE UNITS
PART llic BID TABULATION

2023-2025 BID PRICING

/\\

PART lll ¢ Jefferson Concrete Corp
SQUARE DRAINAGE UNITS .
24" X 24" LAWN Drain.Castch Basin with Grate
: BID PRICE -
El E LE
‘PER FOOT GRATE FRAME RISER CORE $/HO

Polyethylene Price Each NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Precast Concrete Price Each $156.00 $216.00 $190.00 $44.00 INC

Concrete Grade

Ring 24"x24"x2""'
Part IlI-C2 Square Drainage Units - 36" x 36" Lawn Drain/Catch BID PRICE

El LE

Basin with Grate PER FOOT GRATE : FRAME RISER CORE $/HO
Polyethylene Price Each NQO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Precast Concrete Price Each $258.00 $667.00 $306.00 $108.00 INC

Concrete Grade

Ring 3'x3'x2"'
Deviations NO
ALL DATA IS.PRELIMINARY AND DOCUMENTED AT THE TIME OF BID OPENING,
SUBJECT TO ERRORS OR'OMISSIONS. TH'I/S DATA SHOULD NOT BE INTERPRETED AS CONFIRMATION
OF BID RESULTS UNyéSS SIGNED BYTHE JEFFERSON COUNTY PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
THIS.BID"TABULATYON DOES.NGT IMPLY AN AWARD HAS BEEN MADE UNLESS NOTED.
7 S )
/ | 3/21/2023
S / PURCHASING DEPT DATE




