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APRIL 24, 2023

NOTICE OF AWARD

ATTN ROBERT SARTWELL ATTN KEVIN YOUNGS
MCQUADE & BANNIGAN WHITE CAP

1300 STARK ST 30 HILL STREET
UTICA NY 13502 MASSENA NY 13662

ATTN DAVID LESPERANCE
HANES SUPPLY INC.
22432 US RT 11
WATERTOWN NY 13601
BID #2023H-15 NAME: BRIDGE MAINTENANCE MATERIALS
CONTRACT PERIOD: MAY 1, 2023 THROUGH APRIL 30, 2025

AWARD: BASED ON LOW BID PER TABULATION

Dear Mr. Lesperance, Mr. Sartwell and Mr. Youngs:

| am pleased to inform you that your Bid submitted for the solicitation referenced has been accepted based on full
compliance with the specifications, terms and conditions included in the Bid.

Submittal Requirements have been met. The following documents are pending:
Purchase Order [ To be issued

If you have any questions regarding this notice of award, please call the Jefferson County Purchasing Department.

Sincerely,

/Zéi’,u’c : 5( o/ ’)L’hé’f"ﬁ Vy

Mark Sachetti, Purchasing Director
MS/kd

C: Department, Auditor, Bid File

SHARED/BIDS/HIGHWAY BID BOOK/2023-2025/ AWARD 2023-15



BID #2023H-15
BRIDGE MAINTENANCE MATERIALS
BID TABULATION

2023-2025 BID PRICES

HANES MCQUADE & WHITE CAP
SUPPLY INC BANNIGAN
ITEM NO. MIN. QTY. MATERIALS, HARDWARE AND SMALL TOOLS PRICE EACH PRICE EACH | PRICE EACH
BM-1 1 3/4" x .023 (100LB ROLL) Steel coil strapping . $201.03 $211.32 $292.59
BM-2 1000 [3/4" x.023 Steel coil strapping seals or clips $60.00 $30.57 $50.00
BM-3 1 50 ft. 12/3 Heavy duty extension cord with LED end ' $127.00 $43.81
BM-4 1 100 ft. 12/3 Heavy duty extension cord with LED end $117.81 $79.55
50 ft. 12/3 extreme cold Heavy duty extension cord o &
BM- 1 - §79.53 NO BID
> with LED end 7953
BM-6 1 100 ft. 10/3 Heavy duty extension cord with LED end $166.75 NO BID
50 ft. 10/3 extreme cold Heavy duty extension cord
BM- 1 § NO BID
7 with LED end ¥67.37
BM-8 1 STANLEY FAT MAX EXTEEM MESURING TAPE 25FT. $27.50  $23.95 NO BID
BM-9 1 [STANLEY FAT MAX EXTEEM MESURING TAPE 30FT. $27.78 NO BID
BM-10 1 3/8" X 20' TRASPORT CHAIN WITH HOOKS $88.00 NO BID
BM-11 3 lnverted.spray can stick holder or spray stick with flag 540.65 NO BID
holder pin & wheel attachment
BM-12 1 3 gallon plastic poly cure Compound Sprayer $108.37 NO BID
BM-13 1 Chapin or equal 2 gallon tripoxy metal sprayer $91.65 $147.33
BM-14 % thctle Gl-ant 5MSP or equal wat.er.WIzard sump pump $152.00 NO BID
with min 1/6th horse power oil filled motor
' X 300’ .burlap f TE
BM-15 ’ 4 .300 ROLLS OF 10 oz. burlap for wet CONCRE NO BID $248.97
Curing
BM-16 1 Rolls of 6 mill plastic ( 20' x 100’ roll) $92.00 g - %84'.157 ’ $102.49
BM-17 1 |Rolls of 6 mill REINFORCED plastic ( 20" x 100 roll) $132.00 | $m200 | $m9.76
BM-18 1 6v heavy duty battery, 11,000 MAH $3.50 NO BID
BM-19 1 2 pack of DeWalt 20 volt 5 Ah Lithium ¢180.00 $229.95 $371.00
BM-20 1 heavy duty 10.5 oz. calk gun with 12:1 mechanical - : e 200
advantage v
heavy duty 30 oz. calk gun with 12:1 mechanical e
BM-21 1 ! 1 29.00
advantage - $9.50 #3151 328
Special calk gun for 28 oz. for use with 2 part Simson
BM-22 1 AT30 or equal (Note: Gun has a small and large push $146.98 NO BID
ram.)
n
BM-101 | 250 LF 1" SOFT WOOD Chamfer STRIP (Banack wood type NG BID : Esomoe
preferred) :
" C SR
BM-102 | 250 LF 3/4" SOFT WOOD Chamfer STRIP (Banack wood type K I Lo —_—
preferred)
BM-103 20 1" PLASTIC Chamfer CORNERS FOR FORM ENDS NO BID NO BID NO BID
BM-104 20 3/4" PLASTIC Chamfer CORNERS FOR FORM ENDS NO BID NO BID NO BID
Round plastic reinforcement BAR SPACERS to fit .
BM-105 200 |number 5 reinforcement bar and allow for a 2.5" NO BID $0.57 NO BID
spacing between reinforcement bar and face of form. :
BM-106 100 |Standard wedge bolt for Symons type form system NO BID $0.38 $40.00
BM-107 100  |short wedge bolt for Symons type form system NO BID NO BID NO BID
BM-108 100 |long wedge bolt for Symons type form system NO BID NO BID $106.00
n H 1 ' H
BM-109 30 1/.2 Thick 5' x 8' sheets of Harris 1500 Brand g ply black NO BID NO BID NO BID
birch plywood
BM-110 1600 Aluminum drive flush rivets for attaching plywood to NO BID NO BID 0500

Symons steel ply forms




BID #2023H-15
BRIDGE MAINTENANCE MATERIALS
BID TABULATION

2023-2025 BID PRICES

HANES MCQUADE & WHITE CAP
. SUPPLY INC BANNIGAN
BM-111 1 #9 form tie WIRE 50LB COIL f #c;;:j::w . $112.04 $114.37
BM-112 1 #16 gauge form tie WIRE (385 foot COIL) #c:::r” $6.95 $7.95
#19 gauge import steel tie wire, #381TW1061T for e i
BM-11 o] NO BID 1.2 - . :
3| 3 Twintier Max USA #RB441T s
BM-114 50 |Xflat wall ties for Symons type form system 10" NO BID $34.50
BM-115 50 |Xflat wall ties for Symons type form system 12" NO BID $35.50
BM-116 50 |Xflat wall ties for Symons type form system 15" NO BID NO BID
BM-117 50 |Xflat wall ties for Symons type form system 18" NO BID $63.00
BM-118 50 |Xflat wall ties for Symons type form system 24" NO BID $93.00
BM-119 50 X flat wall ties for Symons type form system 36" NO BID NO BID
BM-120 50 1/2" x 4" screw on coil ties for concrete NO BID $139.00
BM-121 50 1/2" x 6"screw on coil ties for concrete NO BID $146.50
BM-122 50 1/2" x 8" screw on coil ties for concrete NO BID $154.50
BM-123 50 1/2"" x 10" screw on coil ties for concrete NO BID $156.50
BM-124 50 1/2" x 12" screw on coil ties for concrete NO BID $186.00
BM-125 50 Simpson or equal 1/2" Coil thread Drop in anchors NO BID $35.50
BM-126 10 Dayton or equal 1/2" x 12' Coil Rod NO BID $130.80
BM-127 50 Dayton or equal 1/2" x 3"x4" Square flat washers NO BID $115.00
BM-128 100 |Dayton or equal 1/2" Coil Nut NO BID $25.00
BM-129 50 Da)-/ton T)’l'pe or equal #5 D-101-A Straight Dowel bar NO BID NO BID
Splicer 18" long
= i _ "
BM-130 50 IIia:jygton Type or equal #5 D-101 Straight Dowel- IN 18 NO BID NO BID NO BID
BM-131 50 Da)./ton Type or equal #6 D-101-A Straight Dowel bar NO BID NO BID NO BID
Splicer 18" long
o 1 i n
BM-132 50 Il?)anygton Type or equal #6 D-101 Straight Dowel- IN 18 NO BID NO BID NO BID
BM-133 1 3 1/2 inch KEYWAY or equal screed rail (10' lengths) NO BID $14.69 51330
BM-134 1 4 1/2 inch KEYWAY or equal screed rail (10 ' lengths) NO BID $17.85 $17.00
BM-135 1 5 1/2 inch KEYWAY or equal screed rail (10 ' lengths) NO BID $20.59 $20.00
BM-136 1 KEYWAY or equal removable cap strip 250 foot roll NO BID $130.88 NO BID
BM-137 10 KEYWAY or equal anchoring stakes NO BID - $1.68 $9.40
ITEM NO. MIN. QTY. HIGHCHAIRS PRICE EACH PRICE EACH | PRICE EACH
BM-150 50 1.5" Continuous Highchairs upper NO BID $2.60 $28 Per 50'
S 28.50
BM-152 50 2" Continuous Highchairs upper NO BID . 5193 liersso'
" : : : : $3°
BM-153 50 2.5" Continuous Highchairs upper NO BID NO BID :
Per 50
0 : : . ' $35.50
BM-154 50 3" Continuous Highchairs upper NO BID $2.62 Per 5o
BM-155 50 3.5" Continuous Highchairs upper NO BID NO BID NO BID
BM-156 50 4" Continuous Highchairs upper NO BID $2.85 $43 Per 50'
ITEM NO. MIN. QTY. 5' x 10' SHEETS of WIRE REINFORCING MESH PRICE EACH PRICE EACH | PRICE EACH
BM-157 20 6XxX6Xx4x4D4 NO BID NO BID NO BID
BM-158 20 6X6X6x6 NO BID NO BID NO BID
BM-159 20 6X6X10X10 NO BID NO BID NO BID
BM-160 20 6X6XW7XW7 NO BID NO BID NO BID
BM-161 20 6X6XW2.5XW2.5 NO BID NO BID NO BID
BM-162 20 [6x6xw7xw 7 (epoxy coated) NO BID NO BID NO BID
ITEM DESCRIPTION
ITEM NO. MIN. QTY. EXPANTION JOINT MATERIALS PRICE EACH PRICE EACH | PRICE EACH
BM201 | 10 [12" X10' Expansion Joint Cap NO BID $2.69 $30 Per 100’




BID #2023H-15
BRIDGE MAINTENANCE MATERIALS
BID TABULATION

2023-2025 BID PRICES

HANES

MCQUADE &

WHITE CAP
SUPPLY INC BANNIGAN =
6" Wi 10’ | i
BM-202 10 . ide x 10' Long Asphalt Impregnated Expansion NO BID 457 Per 100"
Joint
" H 1 .
BM-203 i j;oh\,:\:de x 10" Long Asphalt Impregnated Expansion NO BID §73 Per 100"
H "
BM-204 P 1550 Lin Ft. Roll of 5/8" closed cell HBR FOAM BACKER NO BID NO BID
ROD
H "
BM-205 ] 1100 Lin Ft. Roll of 3/4" closed cell HBR FOAM BACKER NO BID NO BID
ROD
i n
BM-386 3 550 Lin Ft. Roll of 1" closed cell HBR FOAM BACKER NO BID NO BID
ROD
- PP
BM-207 B 6 Lin Ft. of 11/2" dia. closed cell HBR FOAM BACKER NO BID NO BID
ROD
BM-208 12 6 Lin Ft. of 2" dia. closed cell HBR FOAM BACKER ROD NO BID NO BID
BM-209 12 6 Lin Ft. of 3" dia. closed cell HBR FOAM BACKER ROD NO BID NO BID
BM-210 12 6 Lin Ft. of 4" dia. closed cell HBR FOAM BACKER ROD NO BID NO BID
n i 1 !
BM-211 ; 1" Thick Extruded Polystyrene Foam 2' x 8' Sheet DOW NO BID NO BID
Blue Board _
11/2" Thick Extruded Polystyrene Foam 2' x 8' Sheet
BM-212 1 BID
DOW Blue Board OBl HE
n H ! 1
BM-213 ] 2" Thick Extruded Polystyrene Foam 2' x 8' Sheet DOW NO BID NO BID
Blue Board
ITEM DESCRIPTION
ITEM NO. MIN. QTY. SEALERS, GROUTS, EPOXYS & ADHESIVES PRICE EACH PRICE EACH | PRICE EACH
BM-301 1 5 GALLON Pale OF NYSDEC approved FORM RELEASE NO BID ’ $50.68 i NO BID
AGENT e
5 GALLON pal OF NYSDEC & NYSDOT APPROVED S
BM-302 1 . 46126 |
2 CONCRETE CURING COMPOUND. NOBID  |meifldses) NOBID
BM-303 1 BAGS OF MASTER BUILDERS D.O.T. approved SET 45 in NO BID : Encospeed : $663.90
50 LBS BAGS - $30.54 Per 10
BAGS OF MASTER BUILDERS D.O.T. approved S88-Cl i
BM-30 10  $52.
il MORTAR in 50 LBS BAG HEER 33200 NOEID
; BASF Master Emaco T1060 or equal rapid setting a0
BM-30 10 BID - 82837 NO BID
85 cement based Concrete repair mortar in 50 |b. bag e : $28 37 2
SPEED CRETE PM or equal Single component, Vertical
BM-306 1 NO BID 6.62 2.62
3 overhead mortar with corrosion inhibitor in 50 Ib. bag 3 %3
B f veti Hi
BM-307 3 ag_? o vetlcgat supren.1e .or equal High strength NO BID 42537 NO BID
vertical patching material in 50 Ib. bag G
5 Gallon pals of SIL-ACT ATS-100 NYSDOT approved
BM-308 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID
9 penetrating sealer (NO SUBSTATUTIONS) © 0
51.7 Gallon drums of SIL-ACT ATS-100 NYSDOT approved
BM-30 1 BI NO BI NO BID
i penetrating sealer (NO SUBSTATUTIONS) NOBID S 0B
BM-310 10 40 oz. kits of Dow 902 two part silicon sealer NO BID NO BID NO BID
BM-311 20 Static Mixing nozzles for Dow 902 sealer NO BID NO BID NO BID
BM-312 6 Tapered nozzles for Dow 902 sealer NO BID NO BID NO BID
1 Pintsi b -
BM-313 g Pint sized cans of P5200 PRIMER for use with Dow NO BID NO BID NO BID
902 sealer
29 oz. tubes of approved Dow 890SL ONE PART
M-31 1
BM-314 SEALANT NO BID NO BID NO BID
29 oz. tubes of approved Dow 888 ONE PART
BM-31 1 BID BID BID
315 SEALANT NO NO NO
B f ARD TILT PATCH (P
BM-316 10 ags.o /‘\R EX or Equal TILT WALL PATCH (Please NO BID 325,37 NO BID
specify size bag)




BID #2023H-15
BRIDGE MAINTENANCE MATERIALS
BID TABULATION

2023-2025 BID PRICES

HANES MCQUADE &
ITE CAP
SUPPLY INC BANNIGAN WHITE CA
I OLOS
BM-317 1 Bags of ARDEX or Equal CD (Please specify size bag) NO BID $82.00
T . 1136 T M Mi hEmnae

BM-318 ; Pags of QUIKRETE No. 1136 or equal Type S Mason Mix NO BID 40.80 NO BID
in 60 Ib. bags St

BM-319 5 ?ags of QUIKRETE or equal concrete Sand topping mix NO BID NO BID NO BID
in 80 Ib. bags

BM-320 P Bags of QUIKRETE No. 1101 or equal concrete mix in 80 NO BID NO BID
Ib. bags

BM-321 ] Bags onUlKWALL or equeil No. 1230-1231 or equal NO BID NO BID
Surface bonding cement mix in 50 Ib. bags

BM-322 10 Bags of type 1 Portland cement in 80 Ib. bags NO BID $17.99
Simpson Strong-Tie AT 9.7 oz. or equal two part epoxy $fis 00

BM-323 10 with mixing nozzle (Note: must fit in standard calk $25.65 Pe§.1o
gun)
Simpson Strong-Tie 30 oz. or equal two part epoxy

BM-324 30 with mixing nozzle (Special calk’'gun required see Bid $72.50 NO BID
Item BM-20)
10.1 0z. Tubes of BASF Master Seal NP1 or equal High $273.90

BM-32 [o] NO BID

325 3 Performance Polyurethane Sealant © Per 30

BM-326 6 10.1 0z. Tubes of BASF Master Seal SL1 or equal High NO BID $18.31ea
Performance Polyurethane Sealant 29 0z
20 oz. can of Inverted tip paint assorted colors as

BM-32 1 : :
327 Faaded $4.75 all $5-29
BM-328 1 5 Gallon pal of premium 4 or 5 year driveway sealer NO BID NO BID NO BID
BM-329 1 5 Gallon pals of tack coat for asphalt NO BID NO BID NO BID
5 Gallon pals of NYSDOT approved Royston or equal =
Bridge deck membrane primer (Note: must be ek

o} 1 | :

BiaE compatible with Bridge Deck Membrane supplied on W2IEID MuiE $18°'82

line BM-335) =
' ' v

BM-331 ; 3 x 50' rolls of NYSDOT approved Royston or equal NO BID NO BID $g'69.7?
Bridge deck membrane 4'%50

BM-332 g Tubes Royston '104—Cmor equal NYSDOT approved NO BID NO BID NO BID
Caulkable Mastic
Bags of PERMA-PATCH or equal Premium asphalt E - PAR

BM- i o 6.

343 >0 patch material in 60 Ib. bags : $1359 $22.31 316.50

BM-334 - Bags of PERMA-PATCH or equal F40 bridge deck repair NO BID NO BID NO BID
patch in 60 Ib. bags
ROCKLIN SYSTEMS INC. or equal 2 part polyurethane-
BM-335 10 aggregate concrete repair in pre measured kit in 5 NO BID NO BID NO BID
gallon flex set pail
BM-336 10 o Ib. Bags of cleaned and dried 3/8 inch pea gravel NO BID $ #1030
33 50 1b. Bag 3 peag 9-95 Per 10 Bag
Black Beauty orange bag or equal 1240 medium grit : $103.00
BM- . 5
337 1° Sand Blasting slag $12.00 {51; 7 Per 10 Bag
Black Beauty orange bag or equal 2040 fine grit Sand - $103.00
-338 . B
BM33 1° Blasting slag ¥13.00 ,$‘12 s Per 10 Bag
ITEM NO. MIN. QTY. DRILL BITS AND SAW BLADES PRICE EACH PRICE EACH | PRICE EACH
: Spline drive Masonry drill bit size 1/2" x 12"(Note: fits =
BM-401 ! Bosch electric hammer drills) 33150 7$24.687 NO BID
Spline drive Masonry drill bit size 5/8" x 12"(Note: fits - :
BM- . o NO BID
kin ! Bosch electric hammer drills) ¥34:50 #37:02 0
Spline drive Masonry drill bit size 1" x 12"(Note: fits
- o . |
BM-403 ! Bosch electric hammer drills) $43.00 b MGG
BM-404 1 Spline drive Masonry drill bit_size 1-1/4" x 12"(Note: fits $63.50 $53.76 NO BID
Spline drive Masonry drill bit size 1-1/2" x 12"(Note: fits :
BM- 5 - NO BID
e ! Bosch electric hammer drills) $7475 ¥75-74
: : I hit o " " . fi
BM-406 4 Spline drive Masonry drill bit size 1/2" x 18"(Note: fits 55 75 ok NO BID

Bosch electric hammer drills)




BID #2023H-15
BRIDGE MAINTENANCE MATERIALS
BID TABULATION

2023-2025 BID PRICES

HANES MCQUADE &
SUPPLY INC BANNIGAN WHITE CAP
Spline drive Masonry drill bit size 5/8" x 18"(Note: fits o
BM- A ; 92
M-407 Bosch electric hammer drills) +40.00 : $3792 G NOEIR
Spline drive Masonry drill bit size 1" x 18"(Note: fits S
BM-408 : ot -
e Bosch electric hammer drills) 75250 - “9'44 NOBID
BM-409 Spline drive Masonry drill bit size 1-1/4" x 18"(Note: fits $83.75 3 NO BID
Spline drive Masonry drill bit size 1-1/2"" x 18"(Note: fits
BM- .
i Bosch electric hammer drills) D00 NOBID
Spline drive Masonry drill bit size 1/2" x 22"(Note: fits o
BM- 3 o
il Bosch electric hammer drills) 344.50 %3352 HRRD
Spline drive Masonry drill bit size 5/8" x 22"(Note: fits s
BM-41 : 7 .
e Bosch electric hammer drills) , $50.75 356.14 NOBID
Spline drive Masonry drill bit size 1" x 22"(Note: fits
BM- . .
413 Bosch electric hammer drills) $64.50 $49-44 NOBID
Spline drive Masonry drill bit size 1-1/4" x 22"(Note: fits
BM-41 ; X
4 Bosch electric hammer drills) S50 ¥64.91 NEED
Spline drive Masonry drill bit size 1-1/2"" x 22"(Note: fits
BM- 4 .
415 Bosch electric hammer drills) ~105/00 =005 NO@L2
Spline drive Masonry drill bit size 1/2" x 28"(Note: fits
BM- i .
417 Bosch electric hammer drills) #53.50 336.51 NOBID
Spline drive Masonry drill bit size 5/8" x 28"(Note: fits
BM- i .
418 Bosch electric hammer drills) =000 36514 HORIE
Spline drive Masonry drill bit size 1" x 28"(Note: fits :
BM- 5. ¢
42 Bosch electric hammer drills) :$f‘"j,‘m : $130.83 NOER
BM-420 Spline drive Masonry drill bit size 1-1/4" x 28" (Note: fits $177.00 $153.00 NO BID
. . . . . 25 n " . £ TP s SHE
BM-421 Spline drive Masonw drlllplt size 1-1/2" x 28"(Note: fits . oo NO BID NO BID
Bosch electric hammer drills)
Rock drill steel with 1-1/4" hex shank and male H type : :
BM-422 ol .
4 thread 2'lang $66.11 7 $67.35 NO BID
Rock drill steel with 1-1/4" hex shank and male H type S
BM- . : o
423 thread 3' long 37oRY j'$67 35 NORID
Rock drill steel with 1-1/4" hex shank and male H type
BM-424 thread 4! long $103.00 :$70.9o NO BID
1-1/2" Rock drill bit with female H type tread and :
BM- o §
425 carbide X type tip $23: ad 355:02 NG BiD
-5/8" Rock drill bit with fi
BM-426 1 5/8. ock dri .blt with female H type tread and NO BID ok NO BID
carbide X type tip - :
-3/4" R ill bit wi s
BM-427 1 3/4. ock dri .blt with female H type tread and NO BID . 46569 NO BID
carbide X type tip i
" o . . . % : £
BM-428 2 Roc'k drill bit with female H type tread and carbide X 42058 £ ad NO BID
type tip :
2-1/2" Rock drill bit with female H type tread and - :
BM- K
429 carbide X type tip NO BID $109.06 NO BID
" TR :
BM-430 3 Rosk drill bit with female H type tread and carbide X NO BID NO BID NO BID
type tip
Jack hammer bit with 1-1/8" hex shank approx. 12" long | #TPN60070 -
BM- ~ $8.
431 with narrow chisel point $23.19 $§ 9 NOTED
Jack hammer bit with 1-1/8" hex shank approx. 12" long | #TPN60080
BM- £
432 with wide (3-4") chisel point $25.70 7$18 77 NOBID
Jack hammer bit with 1-1/8" hex shank approx. 12" long | #TPN60060 i
BM- s
433 with moil point $23.19 e NG BIR
Jack hammer bit with 1-1/4" hex shank approx. 12" long | #TPN60100 :
BM- o
434 with narrow chisel point $26.74 12E89 NO Bl
Jack hammer bit with 1-1/4" hex shank approx. 12" long | #TPN60090
BM- i
435 with moil point $26.74 13 NOBID
Milwaukee or equal 3PK 8 Tooth COMPACT
BM-436 PORTABAND BLADES (must fit Milwaukee portable #M:‘MOORSE $17.39 NO BID
band saw model 6230) 3:5
Milwaukee or equal 3PK 10 Tooth COMPACT
BM-437 PORTABAND BLADES (must fit Milwaukee portable #M;(:;‘;):SE $17.39 NO BID

band saw model 6230)




BID #2023H-15
BRIDGE MAINTENANCE MATERIALS
BID TABULATION

2023-2025 BID PRICES
HANES MCQUADE &
SUPPLY INC BANNIGAN SUTEEN
Milwaukee or equal 3PK 14 Tooth COMPACT
BM-438 1 PORTABAND BLADES (must fit Milwaukee portable - $17.11 NO BID
band saw model 6230)
Milwaukee or equal 3PK 18 Tooth COMPACT
BM-439 1 PORTABAND BLADES (must fit Milwaukee portable $17.11 NO BID
band saw model 6230)
Milwaukee or equal 3PK 24 Tooth COMPACT
BM-440 1 PORTABAND BLADES (must fit Milwaukee portable $18.38 NO BID
band saw model 6230)
Milwaukee or equal 3PK 10 Tooth COMPACT
BM-441 1 PORTABAND BLADES (must fit Milwaukee portable $18.38 NO BID
band saw model 2629-20 18 volt )
Milwaukee or equal 3PK 14 Tooth COMPACT
BM-442 1 PORTABAND BLADES (must fit Milwaukee portable $18.38 NO BID
band saw model 2629-20 18 volt )
Milwaukee or equal 3PK 18 Tooth COMPACT
BM-443 1 PORTABAND BLADES (must fit Milwaukee portable $18.38 NO BID
band saw model 2629-20 18 volt )
Milwaukee or equal 3PK 24 Tooth COMPACT
BM-444 1 PORTABAND BLADES (must fit Milwaukee portable 7 9 $18.87 NO BID
band saw model 2629-20 18 volt ) #1700
Dewalt
BM-445 SDS type masonry drill bit 5/16 x 7" #TCU 17320 NO BID
$10.50
" Dewalt
BM-446 1 |SDS type masonry drill bit 5/16 x 5"  #TCU7175 $5.20 NO BID
a5
 Dewalt
BM-447 1 SDS type masonry drill bit 3/8" x 8" - #TCU17324 $8.19 NO BID
$8.00
Dewalt
BM-448 1 SDS type masonry drill bit 1/2" x 8" #TCU 17188 NO BID
$12.15
Dewalt
BM-449 1 SDS type masonry drill bit 3/4" x 8" #TCU 17370 NO BID
$21.75
Dewalt
BM-450 1 SDS type masonry drill bit 1" x 8" #TCU 17400 NO BID
$24.25 e
NO NO =
Percent Discount off MSRP On Items Not Listed PERCENTAGE | PERCENTAGE . 5#
LISTED LISTED e
COMMENTS:
DEVIATIONS: NO YES NO
ALL DATA IS PRELIMINARY AND DOCUMENTED AT THE TIME OF BID OPENING,
SUBJECT TO ERRORS OR OMISSIONS. THIS DATA SHOULD NOT BE INTERPRETED
AS CONFIRMATION OF BID RESULTS UNLESS SIGNED BY THE JEFFERSON COUNTY
PURCHA§'(NG DEPARTMENT. THIS BID TABULATION DOES NOT IMPLY AN AWARD
HAS BEEN MADE UNLESS N@TED. )
VAR &r~4N [
P}JRCHASING DEPARTMENT - T DATE




