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NOTICE OF AWARD

April 24, 2023

ATTN MARK THOMPSON
JEFFERSON CONCRETE CORP.
22850 COUNTY ROUTE 51
WATERTOWN NY 13601

BID #2023H-14

NAME: DRAINAGE GRATES AND FRAMES

CONTRACT PERIOD: MAY 1, 2023 THROUGH APRIL 30, 2025

Dear Mr. Thompson:

I am pleased to inform you that your Bid submitted for the solicitation referenced has been accepted based on full
compliance with the specifications, terms and conditions included in the Bid. )

The following documents are required before a Contract/Purchase Order is issued:

V W-g Tax Form and Vendor Information Form (Attached)

If you have any questions regarding this notice of award, please call the Jefferson County Purchasing Department.

Sincerely,

Sachttl,

Mark Sachetti, Purchasing Director

MS/kd

C:  Department, Auditor, Bid File

Purchasing/Shared/Bids/Hwy Bid Book/Awards Highway/Award 2023H-14



BID #2023H -14
DRAINAGE GRATES AND FRAMES

BID TABULATION
2023-2025 BID PRICING
JEFFERSON CONCRETE CORP.
NYSDOT
FRAME & | WTLBS.| FRAME DIMENSIONS EST. QTY. PRICE BID °
GRATE #
RECTANGULAR FRAME . FRAME ' GRATE
3. 86 225/8"” X36 12" 10 $220.00 $331.00
6 79 3/8 253/16"” X 26 1/2” 10 ~ $186.00 $330.00
1 | 108 275/8"” X 36 1/2" 10 $211.00 $420.00
16 176 3/8 30 3/16” X 46 12" 10 $281.00 $666.00
.22 172 37 11/16” X 411/2” 10 $286.00 . $670.00
_ RETICULINE FRAME . FRAME GRATE
3 118 22 11/16” X 36 1/2"! 10 $220.00 $576.00
6 107 - 25 3/16" X 26 1/2” . 10 $186.00 o $509.00
1 147 27 11/16"” X 36 1/2” 10 : $211.00 B $690.00
16 233 30 316" X 46 1/2” 10 i $281.00 $1,054.00
22 231 37 11/16” X 411)2” 10 " $286.00 $1,066.00
a1 165 24 12” X 27 1/2" 2 i $898.00 - $487.00
G2 224 2412” X371/2" 2 - | $1,130.00 . $616.00
a3 282 24 12" X 47127 2 $1,426.00 $749.00
' 25 $30,588.00 $66,824.00
—
JEFFERSON CONCRETE CORP.
MANHOLE EXTENSION (PAVING) RINGS ++ . ‘ PRICE BID
FITS 24" DIAMETER COVER -
STEEL ADJUSTABLE :
" ] $288.00
1.5" : . $288.00 .
oM ) $288.00
25" $330.00
POLY* ADJUSTABLE | [
1" ' -NO BID
1.5" " , NO BID
by NO BID
2.5" . NO BID
STEEL NON-ADJUSTABLE - | |
4" NO BID
1.5" ) .. ...NoBID
Y NO BID
2.5" NO BID
POLY* NON-ADJUSTABLE [ [
1" NO BID
1.5" NO BID
St ) NO BID
2.5" _ . NOBID




BID

#2023H -14

DRAINAGE GRATES AND FRAMES
BiD TABULATION

20232025 BID PRICING

JEFFERSON CONCRETE CORP.

NYSDOT

FRAME & WTLBS.|| FRAME DIMENSIONS EST. QTY. PRICE BID
GRATE #
*Polyethelene/Polyurethane
++ Rings fits Manholes of Standard #1310 Syracuse Castings Type Design
NOMINAL THICKNESS RJA:::;FED :
STEEL/RUBBER TAPERED ASROSS TAPER REQUIRED ACROSS OPENING
(INFRA RISER) : :
OPENING
‘ 1/211 " 1‘1/2"
5t 12" $60.00 $64.00 $74.00
1" 1/2" $74.00 $87.00 $111.00
1.5" 12" $97.00 -$124.00 $126.00
s 1/2" $140.00 $134.00 $150.00
2.5" 1/2" $166.00 $169.00 $171.00
3" 12" $186.00 $186.00 "$210.00
Airport Drainage Inlet Frame & Single Grate :
WEIR
Frame SQUARE FEET OPEN PERIMETER
LINEAR FEET
Weight Dimensions |
207 Lbs 53/2"” X 32" X 27" $347.00 $694.00
Grate
Weight Dimensions v
320 Lbs 24 7/8" X 25 5/8" 3/12" $467.00 $934.00
DEVIATIONS: NO
ALL DATA IS PRELIMINARY AND DOCUMENTED AT THE TIME OF BID OPENING,
SUBJECT TO ERROR; OR OMISSIONS. THIS DATA SHOULD NOT BE INTERPRETED AS CONFIRMATION
OF Bll? RESULTS}J]QLESS SIGNED BY THE JEFFERSON COUNTY PURCHASING DEPARTMENT ~
THlSlélD TABUfATION DOES NOT IMPLY AN AWARD HAS BEEN MADE UNLESS NOTED.
\L //7 I / |
C e 3/21/2023
' PURCHASING DEPT. DATE




