

# County of Jefferson

Office of the Purchasing Department  
Historic Court House  
195 Arsenal Street  
Watertown, New York 13601-2565  
Phone: 315-785-3077  
Fax: 315-785-7591



Email Addresses:  
marks@co.jefferson.ny.us  
karind@co.jefferson.ny.us  
amccracken@co.jefferson.ny.us  
avisg@co.jefferson.ny.us  
mshear@co.jefferson.ny.us

Buyers  
Karin Dorr  
Amanda McCracken

Director  
Mark Sachetti, CPPB

Senior Account Clerk  
Avis Gilmore

Account Clerk  
Mary Ann Shear

## NOTICE OF AWARD

**APRIL 24, 2023**

**ATTN MARC STEMERMAN  
CHEMUNG SUPPLY CORP  
PO BOX 527  
ELMIRA NY 14902**

**ATTN MR ROB SARTWELL  
MCQUADE & BANNIGAN  
22696 MURROCK CIRCLE  
WATERTOWN NY 13601**

**ATTN MR KEVIN YOUNGS  
WHITE CAP  
30 HILL STREET  
MASSENA NY 13662**

**BID #2023H-13**

**NAME: GEOTEXTILES**

**CONTRACT PERIOD: MAY 1, 2023 THROUGH APRIL 30, 2025**

**AWARD: BASED ON LOW BID PER TABULATION**

**Dear Mr. Stemerma, Mr. Sartwell, Mr. Youngs:**

I am pleased to inform you that your Bid submitted for the solicitation referenced has been accepted based on full compliance with the specifications, terms and conditions included in the Bid.

**Submittal Requirements have been met. The following documents are pending:**

Purchase Order / To be issued

If you have any questions regarding this notice of award, please call the Jefferson County Purchasing Department.

Sincerely,

  
Mark Sachetti, Purchasing Director

MS/kd

C: Department, Auditor, Bid File, Ferguson Waterworks

# County of Jefferson

Office of the Purchasing Department  
Historic Court House  
195 Arsenal Street  
Watertown, New York 13601-2565  
Phone: 315-785-3077  
Fax: 315-785-7591



Email Addresses:  
marks@co.jefferson.ny.us  
karind@co.jefferson.ny.us  
amcracken@co.jefferson.ny.us  
avisg@co.jefferson.ny.us  
mshear@co.jefferson.ny.us

Buyers  
Karin Dorr  
Amanda McCracken

Director  
Mark Sachetti, CPPB

Senior Account Clerk  
Avis Gilmore

Account Clerk  
Mary Ann Shear

## NOTICE OF AWARD

**APRIL 24, 2023**

**ATTN LUIS RODRIQUEZ  
FERGUSON WATERWORKS  
6040 DROTT DRUVE  
EAST SYRACUSE NY 13057**

**BID #2023H-13**

**NAME: GEOTEXTLES**

**CONTRACT PERIOD: MAY 1, 2023 THROUGH APRIL 30, 2025**

**AWARD: BASED ON LOW BID PER TABULATION**

**Dear Mr. Rodriguez,**

I am pleased to inform you that your Bid submitted for the solicitation referenced has been accepted based on full compliance with the specifications, terms and conditions included in the Bid.

**The following documents are required before a Contract/Purchase Order is issued:**

✓ W-9 Tax Form and Vendor Information Form (Attached)

If you have any questions regarding this notice of award, please call the Jefferson County Purchasing Department.

Sincerely,

Mark Sachetti, Purchasing Director

MS/kd

C: Department, Auditor, Bid File, Chemung Supply, McQuade & Bannigan, White Cap

2023-2025 BID PRICING

PART II SOIL CONTROL REINFORCEMENT/EROSION ABATEMENT MATERIAL

ITEM DESCRIPTION RATE	ROLL DIMENSIONS AVAILABLE (LIST)	PRICE PER SQ. YD	APPROXIMATE REQUIRED SQ. YD	ROLL DIMENSIONS AVAILABLE (LIST)	PRICE PER SQ. YD	APPROXIMATE REQUIRED SQ. YD	ROLL DIMENSIONS AVAILABLE (LIST)	PRICE PER SQ. YD	APPROXIMATE REQUIRED SQ. YD	ROLL DIMENSIONS AVAILABLE (LIST)	PRICE PER SQ. YD	APPROXIMATE REQUIRED SQ. YD
EROSION CONTROL MATTING												
Completely Organic	8' X 112.5'	\$1.96		8' X 112.5'	\$0.70	#ACFEN518112	8' X 112.5'	\$0.80		NO BID	NO BID	
1 Dimension Mesh	8' X 112.5'	\$1.36		8' X 112.5'	\$0.30	#ACFB1518112	8' X 112.5'	\$0.35		NO BID	NO BID	
2 Dimension Mesh	8' X 112.5'	\$0.575		8' X 112.5'	\$0.34	#ACFB1528112	8' X 112.5'	\$0.40		NO BID	NO BID	
3 Dimension Mesh	8' X 67.5'	\$2.47		8' X 112.5'	\$2.80	#ACFB15308112	8' X 112.5'	\$3.48		NO BID	NO BID	
Completely Inorganic (Life Greater Than 3 Years)	8' X 112.5'	\$4.28		8' X 112.5'	\$2.50	#ACFEC2280112	8' X 112.5'	\$3.25		NO BID	NO BID	
Cellular Confinement System	ROLL DIMENSIONS AVAILABLE (LIST)	PRICE PER SQ. YD	APPROXIMATE REQUIRED SQ. YD	ROLL DIMENSIONS AVAILABLE (LIST)	PRICE PER SQ. YD	APPROXIMATE REQUIRED SQ. YD	ROLL DIMENSIONS AVAILABLE (LIST)	PRICE PER SQ. YD	APPROXIMATE REQUIRED SQ. YD	ROLL DIMENSIONS AVAILABLE (LIST)	PRICE PER SQ. YD	APPROXIMATE REQUIRED SQ. YD
Cell Seam Peel Strength (Greater than 200 lbs.) Wall Thickness (Greater than or equal to 50 mils.)	4" X 21.4" 6" X 21.4" 8" X 21.4"	\$241.50 \$314.23 \$377.52	500	6" X 17.85" X 27.4" #ACFBS10190629	\$8.64 SY	500	6" GEOWEB SIZE PER REQUEST	\$13.20	500	NO BID	NO BID	500
Soil Reinforcement Matting	GEOGRID \$/SY	WOVEN \$/SY	APPROXIMATE REQUIRED SQ. YD	GEOGRID \$/SY	WOVEN \$/SY	APPROXIMATE REQUIRED SQ. YD	GEOGRID \$/SY	WOVEN \$/SY	APPROXIMATE REQUIRED SQ. YD	GEOGRID \$/SY	WOVEN \$/SY	APPROXIMATE REQUIRED SQ. YD
Wide Width Tensile Strength Lb./Ft. Minimum (roll direction)												
2-3000	\$3.60	NO BID	1,000	#2XT/H/P270 \$1.93	\$2.10	1,000	\$1.74	NO BID	1,000	NO BID	NO BID	1,000
3-4000	\$3.75	NO BID	2,000	#3XT/H/P370 \$1.72	\$2.40	2,000	\$1.92	NO BID	2,000	NO BID	NO BID	2,000
4-5000	\$3.75	NO BID	5,000	#5XT/H/P370 \$1.79	\$3.05	5,000	\$1.92	NO BID	5,000	NO BID	NO BID	5,000
5-6000	\$3.85	NO BID	2,000	#7XT \$2.08	NO BID	2,000	\$2.52	NO BID	2,000	NO BID	NO BID	2,000
6-7000	\$4.10	NO BID	1000	#8XT \$2.19	NO BID	1000	\$2.52	NO BID	1000	NO BID	NO BID	1000
7-9000	\$4.45	NO BID	500	#9XT/H/P70 \$2.19	\$4.63	500	\$2.76	NO BID	500	NO BID	NO BID	500
10,000 and up	\$5.20	NO BID	500	#20XT \$3.99	NO BID	500	\$4.38	NO BID	500	NO BID	NO BID	500
Comments:	* 3XT, 5XT, 7XT, 8XT, 20XT UNUSUAL GRIDS*											
Deviations	NO											
ALL DATA IS PRELIMINARY AND DOCUMENTED AT THE TIME OF BID OPENING, SUBJECT TO ERRORS OR OMISSIONS. THIS DATA SHOULD NOT BE INTERPRETED AS CONFIRMATION OF BID RESULTS UNLESS SIGNED BY THE JEFFERSON COUNTY PURCHASING DEPARTMENT. THIS BID TABULATION DOES NOT IMPLY AN AWARD HAS BEEN MADE UNLESS NOTED.												
PURCHASING DEPT												3/24/2023
												DATE

PART I: GEOTEXTILES		CHEMUNG SUPPLY		FEQUSON WATERWORKS		MCQUADE & BANNIGAN		WHITE GAP	
MANUFACTURER:	HANES	ACF ENVIRONMENTAL	ACF ENVIRONMENTAL	Not Specified	Not Specified	TenCate	TenCate	Mirafi	
BRAND NAME:	Not Specified	Not Specified	Not Specified	Not Specified	Not Specified	Not Specified	Not Specified	Not Specified	Not Specified
Name of Material (must be on MYSOT approved list)	EP	CS-350	NO. 6	NO. 8	HD				
Roll Dimensions Available (LxS)	12' X 300'	12.5' X 360'	12.5' X 360'	12.5' X 360'	12.5' X 360'				
APPLICATION	B Geotextile Bedding	S Geotextile Separation	D Geotextile Drainage	SP Geotextile Slope Protection	ST Geotextile Stabilization				
PRICE PER SQ. YD.	\$2.93	\$0.840	\$1.37	\$1.98	\$1.07				
Name of Material (must be on MYSOT approved list)	MISON	S90N	N06N	N08N	S90N				
Roll Dimensions Available (LxS)	12' X 300'	12.5' X 360'	9' X 300'	15' X 300'	12.5' X 360'				
APPLICATION	B Geotextile Bedding	S Geotextile Separation	D Geotextile Drainage	SP Geotextile Slope Protection	ST Geotextile Stabilization				
PRICE PER SQ. YD.	\$2.06	\$0.82	\$1.06	\$1.30	\$0.82				
Name of Material (must be on MYSOT approved list)	HANES EP	HANES CS-350	HANES N06	HANES N08	HANES HD				
Roll Dimensions Available (LxS)	12' X 300'	12.5' X 360'	15' X 300'	15' X 300'	12.5' X 360'				
APPLICATION	B Geotextile Bedding	S Geotextile Separation	D Geotextile Drainage	SP Geotextile Slope Protection	ST Geotextile Stabilization				
PRICE PER SQ. YD.	\$2.37	\$0.76	\$1.14	\$1.90	\$0.90				
Name of Material (must be on MYSOT approved list)	WIRFIB 2199	MIRAFI 160N	MIRAFI 160N	MIRAFI 180N	MIRAFI 600K				
Roll Dimensions Available (LxS)	12' X 300'	15' X 300'	15' X 300'	15' X 300'	12.5' X 360'				
APPLICATION	B Geotextile Bedding	S Geotextile Separation	D Geotextile Drainage	SP Geotextile Slope Protection	ST Geotextile Stabilization				
PRICE PER SQ. YD.	\$3.69	\$1.14	\$1.14	\$1.53	\$1.18				
3606-D-452-D	3' X 50'	CM Geomembranes	PVD Prefabricated Vertical Drain with Connections	TERRADRAIN 56	4' X 50'	PVD Prefabricated Vertical Drain with Connections	TERRADRAIN 56	4' X 50'	PVD Prefabricated Vertical Drain with Connections
NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$7.94	\$7.94	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
3606-D-452-D	3' X 50'	CM Geomembranes	PVD Prefabricated Vertical Drain with Connections	TERRADRAIN 06	4' X 50'	PVD Prefabricated Vertical Drain with Connections	TERRADRAIN 06	4' X 50'	PVD Prefabricated Vertical Drain with Connections
NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$9.81	\$9.81	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Erosion Control Sediment Logs 12" x 10' Am Excelsior (oe)	12" X 10'	Erosion Control Sediment Logs 12" x 10' Am Excelsior (oe)	12" X 10'	Erosion Control Sediment Logs 20" x 10' Am Excelsior (oe)	20" X 10'	Erosion Control Sediment Logs 20" x 10' Am Excelsior (oe)	20" X 10'	Erosion Control Sediment Logs 20" x 10' Am Excelsior (oe)	20" X 10'
\$36.50	\$31.00	\$44.00	\$31.00	\$83.33	\$31.00	\$83.33	\$31.00	\$24.99	
Erosion Control Sediment Logs 20" x 10' Am Excelsior (oe)	20" X 10'	Erosion Control Sediment Logs 20" x 10' Am Excelsior (oe)	20" X 10'	Erosion Control Sediment Logs 20" x 10' Am Excelsior (oe)	20" X 10'	Erosion Control Sediment Logs 20" x 10' Am Excelsior (oe)	20" X 10'	Erosion Control Sediment Logs 20" x 10' Am Excelsior (oe)	20" X 10'
\$54.50	\$44.00	\$44.00	\$44.00	\$224.35	\$44.00	\$224.35	\$44.00	NO BID	
Fabric Check Dam: Gully Guard or Equal	7" X 4' 7" X 7'	Fabric Check Dam: Gully Guard or Equal	7" X 4' 7" X 7'	Fabric Check Dam: Gully Guard or Equal	7" X 4' 7" X 7'	Fabric Check Dam: Gully Guard or Equal	7" X 4' 7" X 7'	Fabric Check Dam: Gully Guard or Equal	7" X 4' 7" X 7'
NO BID	NO BID	\$65.00	\$65.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Drain/Guard, Reusable	24" X 36"	Drain/Guard, Reusable	24" X 36"	Drain/Guard, Reusable	24" X 36"	Drain/Guard, Reusable	24" X 36"	Drain/Guard, Reusable	24" X 36"
\$84.00	\$36.00	\$36.00	\$36.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Storm Waste	9' X 35'	Storm Waste	9' X 35'	Storm Waste	9' X 35'	Storm Waste	9' X 35'	Storm Waste	9' X 35'
\$41.20	\$35.00	\$35.00	\$35.00	\$33.97	\$35.00	\$33.97	\$35.00	NO BID	NO BID
NO BID	NO BID	\$370.41	\$270.41	\$756.37	\$370.41	\$756.37	\$370.41	\$128.03	NO BID
WATERPROOF MEMBRANE ADHESIVE:	NO BID	WATERPROOF MEMBRANE ADHESIVE:	NO BID	WATERPROOF MEMBRANE ADHESIVE:	NO BID	WATERPROOF MEMBRANE ADHESIVE:	NO BID	WATERPROOF MEMBRANE ADHESIVE:	NO BID