County of Jefferson
Office of the Purchasing Department
Historic Court House

195 Arsenal Street

Watertown, New York 13601-2565
Phone: 315-785-3077

Fax: 315-785-7591

Buyers Director
Karin Dorr Mark Sachetti, CPPB

Amanda McCracken

- Email Addresses:
marks@ co.jefferson.ny.us
karind@co.jefferson.ny.us

amccracken@co.jefferson.ny.us
avisg@ co.jefferson.ny.us
mshear@co.jefferson.ny.us

Senior Account Clerk
Avis Gilmore

Account Clerk
Mary Ann Shear

NOTICE OF AWARD

APRIL 24, 2023

MR MARC STEMERMAN
CHEMUNG SUPPLY CORP
PO BOX 527

ELMIRA NY 14902

BID #2023H-11 ' NAME: STRUCTURAL STEEL

CONTRACT PERIOD: MAY 1, 2023 THROUGH APRIL 30, 2025

Dear Mr. Stemerman:

| am pleased to inform you that your Bid submitted for the solicitation referenced has been accepted based on full

compliance with the specifications, terms and conditions included in the Bid.

Submittal Requirements have been met. The following documents are pending:

Purchase Order | To be'issued

If you have any questions regarding this notice of award, please call the Jefferson County Purchasing Department.

Sincerely,

U‘y/ﬂﬁw ho

‘Mark Sachetti, Purchasing Director
‘MS/kd

C:  Department, Auditor, Bid File

SHARED/BIDS/HIGHWAY BID BOOK 2023-2025/AWARDS HIGHWY 2023H-11



BID #2023H-11

STRUCTURAL STEEL

BID TABULATION

Steel Sheets, Angle Iron,Rolled Stock, Pilings etc. . ]

2023-2025 BID PRICING

CHEMUNG SUPPLY CORP.
GRADE 36/ GRADE 50W
PAINTED No Paint
ITEM NO ANGLE IRON - BID Price / LF BID Price /LF
SA-1  [1/2" x1/2" x1/8" $0.84 ’ $1.16
SA-2  [3/4"x3/4" x1/8" $1.76 $2.16
SA-3  |1"x1"x1/8" $2.40 $2.60
SA-4  |11/4" x 1-1/4" x 1/8" $3.02 $3.02
SA-5  |1-1/2" x1-1/2" x1/8" $3.68 $4.08
SA-6  |1-3/4" x1-3/4"x 1/8" $4.32 $4.72
SA-7  [2"x2"x1/8" $4.99 $5.34
SA-8  |2.5"x2.5"x1/8" NO BID NO BID
SA-9 [1/2" x1/2" x 3/16" NO BID NO BID
SA-10  |3/4" x 3/4" x 3/16" NO BID NO BID
SA-1n 1" x1"3/16" " $3.58 $3.98
SA-12  |1-1/4" X 1-1/4" x 3/16" $4.44 $4.84
SA-13  [11/2" X141/2" x 3/16" $5.40 $5.80
SA-14  |1-3/4" x 1-3/4"x 3/16" $6.36 $6.96
SA-15  |2" x2" x 3/16" $7.32 $7.72
SA-16  |2.5" x 2.5" x 3/16" $9.20 $9.80
SA-17 . |3"x 3" x3/16" $11.12 $11.72
SA-18 |3.5" x3.5" x 3/16" NO BID NO BID
. SA19 |4" x 4" x 3/16" NO BID NO BID
SA-20 [3/4" x 3/4" x1/4" NO BID " NO BID
SA-21 1" x1" x1/4" $4.46 $5.22
SA-22  |+12" x 112" x1/4" $7.02 $7.62
SA-23  |1-3/4" x1-3/4" x /4" $8.30 $8.70
SA-24 [2"x2" x1/4" $9.60 $10.20
SA-25  |2-1/2" x 2-1/2 X 1/4" $12.30 $12.90
SA-26 |3" x3" x.1/4" $14.70 $14.99
SA-27 |341/2" x 3112 x1/4" 17..40 $17.80
SA-28 4" x4"x1/4" $19.80 $20.40
SA-29 |4" x3"5/16" NO BID .NOBID
SA-30 |1"x1"x3/8" NO BID NO BID
SA-31  |2"x2"x3/8" $14.10 $14.70
SA-32  [3"x3"x3/8" $21.60 ©$22.42
SA-33 [3-1/2" x 3-1/2 x 3/8" $25.90 $26.20
‘SA-34 [4"x3"x3/8" $25.50 $26.20
SA-35 |4"x6"x3/8" $36.90 $38.20
SA-36 |6" x6" x 3/8" $44.70. $48.52
SA-37 (4" x4" x12" $38.40 . $40.40
SA-38 |5"x3"x3/8" $29.40 $31.40
SA-39 |5"x6"Xx12" NO.BID ‘NOBID
SA-40 (6" x 6" x1/2" $48.40 $60.80
SA-41 |4"x4" x3/4" ._$55.50 $59.50
SA-42 . |4" x 6" x 3/4" $69.00 $71.00
SA-43 |8"x8"x3/4" $116.70 $120,20
2023-2025 BID PRICING
CHEMUNG SUPPLY CORP.
HOT ROLLED PLATE BID PRICE/SQFT
SP-1 1/8"x 4'x 8' $16.00
SP-2° |3/16" x4'x 8' $22.98 7
SP-3  |1/4"x4'x 8" $30.62
SP-4  [3/8"x4'x 8 $45.91
SP-5  |1/2"x4'x8' $61.23
SP-6 |5/8"x4'x8' $76.58
SP-7  [3/4"x4'x8' $92.04
SP-8 |1"x4'x 8 $122.52
SP-9  [1/8" x 4' x 8' Diamond Plate $18.44
SP-10  |3/16" x 4' x 8' Diamond Plate $26.17
SP-11  [1/4" x 4 x 8' Diamond Plate $33.78




BID #2023H-11

STRUCTURAL STEEL
BID TABULATION
CHEMUNG SUPPLY CORP.
ITEM NO |HOT ROLLED FLATS 20’ lengths BID PRICE/LF
SF-1 18" x2" | : : $1.92
SF2  |1/8" x1" ' . $0.96
SF-3  [1/8" x 112" _ . $1.44
SF-4 18" x 212" : $2.40
ASF-S 1/8" X 4n. ] ' ] $3.,84
.SF-6 1/8" x 6" $5.72
SF-7  |1/8" x 8" : - $6.64
SF-8  |1/8" X 10" - ‘ NO BID
SF-9  |3116" x1" 3 ‘ $1.44
SF-10  [3/16" x1-1/2" $1.16
SF-11__ |3/16" x 2" o : $2.88
SF12  |3/16" x 3" | $4.28
SF13 _ [3/16" x 4" | $5.72
SF-14  |1/4" x1" , L .92
SF-15  [1/4" x 1-1/2" » ' " $2.88
SF-16  |1/4" x 2" R $3.84
SF17 _ |1/4" x3" : : $5.72
SF-18 |1/4" x 4" : , $7.64
SF19 [1/4"x1-1/4" , $2.40
SF-20 |1/4"x 6" ‘ $11.48
SF21_ |1/4"x8" $15.30
SF-22  [1/4" x 10" $19.14
SF-23  [3/8" x1" . . $20.88
SF-24 |3/8" x1-1/2" $4.88
SF-25 [3/8" x 2" . " $5.72
" SF-26  |3/8" x 2-1/2" ' $7.16
SF-27 |3/8"x 3" _ $8.62
SF-28 |3/8"x 4" : $11.64
SF-29 [3/8"x6" $17.24
SF-30 [3/8"x8" ' $23.94
SF-31  [3/8" x10" : © $28.68
SF-32  [1/2" x1/2" : NO BID
SF-33  [1/2" x 1" . $3.84
SF34 [|1/2" x 112" ' $5.72
_SF35 |1)2" x2" §7.64
SF-36  [1/2" x 212" ‘ $9.56
SF37  |12"x3" $11.48
. SF-38 |1/2"x4" ©$15.30
SF-39 (12" x 6" $23.00
SF-40 |[1/2" x 8" $30.62
SF-41  [1/2" x 10" $38.30




Steel Sheets, Angle Iron,
Rolled Stock, Pilings etc. :

~ BID #2023H-11
STRUCTURAL STEEL
BID TABULATION

2023-2025 BID
.PRICING
CHEMUNG SUPPLY
CORP.
ITEM NO BRIDGE FLOORING BID Price / SF
BF-1 |7 gauge, galvanized $59.21
BF-2 |10 gauge, galvanized $58.21
BF-3 |12 gauge, galvanized $57.21
BF-4 |7 gauge, aluminized NO BID
BF-5 |10 gauge, aluminized NO'BID
BF-6 |12 gauge, aluminized NO BID
BF-7  |5" Steel Grid, Grade 36 NOBID
BF-8  |[5" Steel Grid, Grade 50 NO BID
BF-9  |5" Steel Grid, Grade 50W NO BID
ITEMNO HOT ROLLED ROUND STOCK BID Price [ LF
RS-1 1/4" $2.36
RS-2 3/8" $2.84
RS-3 5/16" $2.60
RS-4 12" $3.56
RS-5 5/8" $4.34
RS-6 3/4" $5.38
. RS-7 " $6,00
RS-8 1.25" $9.38
RS-9 1.5" $18.02
ITEM NO WIRE MESH, Each Sheet 5' x 10’ BID Price /LF
WMt [6x6X6Xx6 $37.69
WM-2 [6x6x10x10 $30.18
~ WM3 [6Xx6xw7xw7 $391.00
‘ WM-4 [6x6xw2.5xw2.5 $484.21
WM-5 |6 X6 xw7xw7(epoxy coated) $621.11
ITEM NO \é\'liLZIZI;ZD WIRE FABRIC, Each Sheet BID Price / LF
WM-6 | 6x 6d20o0nd20 $686.27
WM-7 [12x12d20o0ond2o $491.21
WM-8 4 X 4 wqonwg $476.00
ATEM NO TUBING, BOX BID Price [ LF
BT-t 1" x 2" x 1/8" $8.10
BT-2 1" x 1" x 1/8" $6.04
BT-3 |1 x 1" x 3/16" NO BID
BT-4 [1" x 1" x 14" NO BID
BT-5 1" x 1" x 3/8" NO BID
BT-6  [11/2" x11/2" x 1/8" $9.44
BT-7 2" x 2" x /4" $22.70
BT-8 [2" x 2" x 3/8" NO BID
BT-9 {3" x 3" x 1/4" $36.98
BT-10 3" x 3" x 3/8" " $52.50
BT-11 |3" x 5" x 1/4" $51.00
BT-12" [3" x 5" x 3/8" $72.66
BT13 ~ |4" x 4" x 1/4" $51.26
BT-14  {4" x 4" x 3/8" $72.52
BT-15 |5" x 5" x 1/4" $65.58




Steel Sheets, Angle Iron,

BID #2023H-11

Rolled Stock, Pilings etc. STRUCTURAL STEEL
' BID TABULATON
2023-2025 BID PRICES
CHEMUNG SUPPLY CORP.
GRADE 36/ GRADE 50/
v PAINTED PAINTED GRADE 500
ITEMNO [ BEAMS (W SHAPE)| BIDPrice /LF BID Price /LF BlD.E[ls:e_LLE

1B 4" x 13 Ibs. [ ft. $31.80 $33.80 $33.00
IB-2 5" x 19 Ibs. [ ft. $43.02 $45.02 $45.02
IB3 6" x 8.5 Ibs. [ ft. $20.82 $22.82 $22.82

- 1B-4 6"x13 Ibs. [ ft. $31.80 $33.80 $33.80
IBs 6" x 15 Ibs. / ft. . $36.70 $38.70 $38.70
IB-6 6" x 20 Ibs. [ ft. $48.96 $52.96 $52.96
1B7 12" x 26 Ibs. / ft., $63.66 $69.66 © $69.66
IB-8 14" x 109 Ibs. [ ft. $278.32 $298.32 $298.32
IB-9. 16" x 77 Ibs. | ft. $188.50 $208.50 $208.50
IB-10 - 18" x 35 Ibs. [ ft. " $85.68 $97.68 $97.68
IB-11 18" x 50 Ibs. [ ft. $122.42 $142.41 $142.41
'IB-12 21" x 68 [bs. | ft. $166.48 $186.48 $186.48
IB-13 24" x 68 [bs. | ft. - $166.48 $186.48 $186.48
1B-14 24" x 76 Ibs. [ ft. $186.06 $206.06 $206.06
IB-15 24" x 84 Ibs. [ ft. $205.66 $225.66 $225.66
IB-16 24" x 104 Ibs. [ ft. $254.61 $274.67 $274.67
IB-17 27" x 94 Ibs. [ ft. $239.98 $259.98 $259.98
IB-18 30" x 99 Ibs. [ ft. $252.76 ~ $272.76 $272.76
IB-19 33" x 118 Ibs. / ft. $301.28 $321.48 $321.28
IB-20 36" x 210 Ibs. / ft. $558.14 $578.14 $578.14

GRADE 36/ GRADE 50/

, PAINTED PAINTED GRADE 50\
MEMNO BES’migNT BID Price [LE | BIDPrice/LE BID Price /LF
IB-21 7" x 27 Ibs. [ ft. NO BID NO BID NO BID
IB-22 8" x 16 Ibs. [ ft. NO-BID NO BID NO BID
IB-23 13.5" x 42 lbs. [ ft. NO BID NO BID $316.04

GRADE 36/ GRADE50/
PAINTED PAINTED GRADEsoW.
memno  CAMNESC | et | mpesesse | Bopricesss
SC-21 2" x 2.28 Ibs. [ ft. $5.18 $6.18 $6.18
SC-22 3" x5 lbs. [ ft. $11.36 $12.16 $12.16
SC-23 4" x 6.3 |bs. [ ft. $14.34 $15.94 $15.94
SC-24 5" x 6.8 Ibs. [ ft. $15.46 $16.33 $16.33
SC-25 6" x 8.2 Ibs. / ft. $18.64 - $20.64 $20.64
SC-26 8" x 12 Ibs. [ ft. $27.30 $29.30 $29.30
SC-27 9" x 15 Ibs. / ft. 34..12 $36.12 $36.12
SC-28 9" x 20 Ibs. [ ft. $45.50 $49.50. $49.50
SC-29 10" x 15 Ibs. [ ft. $34.12  $36.12 $36.12
SC30 10" x 20 Ibs. [ ft. $45.75 $49.50 $49.50
SC-31 12" x 21 lbs. [ ft. $51.44 $57.44 $57.44
SC-32 12" x 25 Ibs. [ ft. $61.24 $69.24 $69.24
SC-33 15" x 40 Ibs. | ft. $101.20 $108.00 $108.00




Steel Sheets, Angie Iron, BID #2023H-11
.Rolled Stock; Pilings etc. STRUCTURAL STEEL
BID TABULATION

| 2023-2025 BID PRICES
PZ - INTERLOCKING SHEET PILING * CHEMUNG SUPPLY CORP.

ITEM NO ] BID Price | SF
PZA “22" x 3/8" x30' ‘ $69.70
PZ-2 22" x 3/8" x45' ’ $69.70
PZ3 22" x 3/8" x 60" $69.70
-HP SHAPES
BID Price [ LF
ITEM NO
- HP41 10 X 42 : . . . $72.38
HP-2 10 X 57 $88.24
HP-3 . 12 X 53 : $91.34
HP-4 12 x 63 . . $108.56
HP-5 14 X 73 $125.82
HP-6 14 x 89 $153.38
FABRICATION ALTERNATIVE PRICING
Hole I Short Slot I Long Slot I
DRILLING PRICING
ITEMNO
FAB-1 ’ < 13/16" ' NO BID NO BID NO BID
FAB-2 > 13/16" < 1-9/16" NO BID NO BID NO BID
FAB-3 >1-9/16" < 2—1/1_6" NO BID NO BID _NOBID:
COPING PRICING
. BID Price /
FI Thick
ITEM NO ange Thickness Per EA.
FAB-4 <1f2" NO BID
FAB-5 o>t <" NO BID
FAB-6 . >1" < 112" NO BID
STIFFENERS PRICING .
' BID Price [
B Depth
ITEM NO eam Depths Per EA.
FAB-7 <1" NO BID
FAB-8 > <t-12" NO BID
FAB-9 > 1-1/2" < 2-1[2" NO BID
FAB-10 >2-1/2" < 3" NO BID




Steel Sheets, Angle Iron, BID #2023H-11

Rolled Stock, Pilingsetc. -~  STRUCTURAL STEEL
BID TABULATION
REINFORCING ROD o
' 2022-2023 BID PRICES
CHEMUNG SUPPLY CORP.
ITEMNO |500 feet qty, Reinforcing Rod, 20' Lengths: GRADE 60 BAR EPOXz:g:TED’
RB-1  |#3-.375" Dia. (0.376 Ibs.fft.) , $0.77 $1.55
RB-2  [#4-.5" Dia. (0.668 Ibs./ft.) ’ $0.73 $1.45
RB-3 - |#5-.625" Dia. (1.043 Ibs./ft.) $0.73 $1.45
RB-4 #6 -.75" Dia. (1.52bs./ft.) - : $0.73 $1.45
RB-5 #7 - .875" Dia. (2.044 Ibs./ft.) $0.73 $1.45
RB6  |#8-1" Dia.(2.670 Ibs./ft.) . $0.73 $1.45
RB-7 #9 - 1.128" Dia. (3.400 Ibs./ft.) $0.89 $1.45
‘ RB-8  [#10 -1.25" Dia. (4.303 Ibs./ft.) $0.99 $1.55
RB-9 #11- 1.410" Dia. (5.313 Ibs./ft.) . $1.04 - $1.65
RB-10  |#12-1.5" Dia. (5.97 Ibs./ft.) : $1.04 $1.75
IT‘EM NO |Shop Fabrications for reinforcing rod, All Sizes
FAB-11  |Cut to custom length: . $24.00 [ CWT
FAB-12 |Bend to spec: . $28.00 [ CWT
FAB-13 |Alternately ’ $125.00
Delivery Date 7-14._days after receipt
of order, please advise.




Steel Sheets, Angle Iron, BID #2023H-11

Rolled Stock, Pilings etc. STRUCTURAL STEEL
BID TABULATION
2023-2025 BID PRICES
CHEMUNG SUPPLY
CORP.
ITEMNO SHEET METAL : v BID Price / Sq. Ft.
SM-1 4'x8' 8gauge, plain o ' $17.52
SM-2 - 4'x8' 10 gauge, plain o \ $14.34
SM-3 | 4'x8' 12gauge, plain $10.97
SM-4 4'x8' 14gauge, plain . $7.78
SM-5 4'x8' 16 gauge, plain $6.38
SM-6 4'x8' 26 gauge, plain _ _ %Y
SM-7 4'x8' 28 gauge, plain : ) $2.14
SM-8 4'x8' 26 gauge, galvanized _ $4.25
SM-9 | 4'x8' 28 gauge, galvanized v $4.00
SM-10 4'x8' Expanded metal smooth /flat type 1/2", #13 gauge $5.25
SM-11 4'x8' Expanded metal smooth/ flat type 3/4", #13 gauge ) $5.25
SM-12 4'x8' Expanded metal smooth/ flat'type 112", #9 gauge . - $5.06
SM-13 .4'x 8" _ Expanded metal raised or rough type 3/4", #13-gauge $5.06
SM-14 4'x8' Expanded metal raised or rough type 3 1-1/2", #9 gauge $5.06
ITEM NO ROUND TUBING ) ' BID Price / Lin Ft
RT-1 1/2" Schedule 40 Round Tubing : . $2.42
RT-2 3/4" Schedule 40 Round Tubing : : $3.20
RT-3  |1" Schedule 40 Round Tubing - . $4.80
. RT4 1-1/2" Schedule 40 Round Tubing ) ' $7.74
RT-5 2" Schedule 40 Round Tubing : $10.40
RT-6 2-1/2" Schedule 40 Round Tubing ‘ $16.50
RT-7 3" Schedule 40 Round Tubing , $21.60
RT-8 4" Schedule 40 Round Tubing : $30.98
RT-9 5" Schedule 40 Round Tubing ' - $41.66
RT-t0 6" Schedule 40 Round Tubing $54.06
RT-11 8" Schedule 40 Round Tubing _ . $80.32
RT-12 10" Schedule 40 Round Tubing ' $114.39
N/A % DI.SCOUNT OFF MSRP FOR RELATED ITEMS NOT INCLUDED IN
. NO BID:
THIS BID.
DEVIATIONS:
COMMENTS: v
ALL DATA IS PRELIMINARY AND DOCUMENTED AT THE TIME OF BID OPENING,
SUBJECT TO ERRORS OR OMISSIONS. THIS DATA SHOULD NOT BE INTERPRETED
- |AS CONFIRMATION OF BID RESULTS UNLESS SIGNED BY THE JEFFERSON COUNTY
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT. THIS BID TABULATION DOES NOT IMPLY AN AWARD
HAS BEEN MADE UNLESS-NOTED.
/'/ . .
_ 4
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT DATE




