. County of Jefferson
Office of the Purchasing Department
" Historic Court House
195 Arsenal Street :
Watertown, New York 13601-2565
Phone: 315-785-3077
Fax: 315-785-7591

Buyers
Karin Dorr

Amanda McCracken

Director
Mark Sachetti, CPPB

Email Addresses:
marks@ co.jefferson.ny.us
karind@co.jefferson.ny.us

amccracken@co.jefferson.ny.us
avisg@co.jefferson.ny.us
mshear@co.jefferson.ny.us

Senior Account Clerk
Avis Gilmore

Account Clerk
Mary Ann Shear

APRIL 24, 2023

ATTN NORA EBERL
EBERL IRON WORKS INC.
128 SYCAMORE STREET
BUFFALO NY 14304

BID #2023H-10

NOTICE OF AWARD

ATTN DAVID LIGHTLE

LIGHTLE ENTERPRISES OF OHIO LLC

PO BOX 329
22 E SPRINGFIELD Street
FRANKFORT OH 45628

NAME: HIGHWAY SIGNS, SIGN MATERIALS & POSTS

AWARD: BASED ON LOW BID PER TABULATION

CONTRACT PERIOD: MAY 1, 2023 THROUGH APRIL 30, 2025

Dear Ms. Eberl, Mr. Lightle:

~ lam pleased to inform you that your Bid submitted for the solicitation referenced has been accepted based on full -
compliance with the specifications, terms and conditions included in the Bid.

The following documents are required before a Contract/Purchase Order is issued:
vV W-g Tax Form and Vendor Information Form (Attached)

If you have any questions regarding this notice of award, please call the Jefferson County Purchasing Department.

Sincerely,

%’LL QSZE/\WU i

Mark Sachetti, Purchasing Director
MS/kd

C: Department, Auditor, Bid File, Babcock Highway,’ Easterh Metal of Elmira, Chemung Supply, Hanes Supply

Purchasing/Shared/Bids//Hwy Bid Book / Awards Highway/Award 2023H-10 Eberl, Lightle Enterprises



County of Jefferson
Office of the Purchasing Department
Historic Court House

195 Arsenal Street

Watertown, New York 13601-2565
Phone: 315-785-3077

Fax: 315-785-7591

'Buyers
Karin Dorr

Amanda McCracken

Director
Mark Sachetti, CPPB

Email Addresses:
marks@co.jefferson.ny.us
karind@co.jefferson.ny.us

amccracken@co.jefferson.ny.us
avisg@co.jefferson.ny.us
_ mshear@co.jefferson.ny.us

Senior Account Clerk
Avis Gilmore

Account Clerk
Mary Ann Shear

APRIL 24, 2023

NOTICE OF AWARD

ATTN LYN BABCOCK
BABCOCK HIGHWAY SUPPLY
565 COUNTY ROUTE 51A:
OSWEGO NY 13126

ATTN DAVID LESPERANCE
HANES SUPPLY INC.

22432 USRT 11
WATERTOWN NY 13601

- BID #2023H-10

ATTN SHAUN PEDEN

EASTERN METAL OF ELMIRA INC
1430 SULLIVAN STREET

ELMIRA NY 14901

ATTN MARC STEMERMAN
CHEMUNG SUPPLY

PO BOX 527

ELMIRA NY 14902

NAME: HIGHWAY SIGNS, SIGN MATERIALS & POSTS

AWARD: BASED ON LOW BID PER TABULATION

CONTRACT PERIOD: MAY 1, 2022 THROUGH APRIL 30, 2023

. Dear Mr. Ba_bcc;:ck, Mr. Peden, Mr. Lesperance, Mr. Stemerman:

| am pleased to inform you that your Bid submitted for the solicitation referenced has been accepted based on full
compliance with the specifications, terms and conditions included in the Bid.

Submittal Requfrements have been met. The following documents are pending:
Purchase Order | To be issued

If you have any questions regarding this notice of award, please call the Jefferson County Purchasing Department.

Sincerely, -
“Vhari-decheti o

Mark Sachetti, Purchasing Director

MS/kd

C:  Department, Auditor, Bid F.ilen; Eberl Iron Works Inc, 'Lightle Enterprises of Ohio LLC

Purchasing/Shared/bids/Hwy Bid Book/Awards Highway 2023H-10 Babcock Highway, Eastern Metal, Hanes, Chemung



BID #2023H-10

HIGHWAY SIGNS, SIGN MATERIALS AND POSTS

BID TABULATION

2023-2025 Bid Pricing

LIGHTLE ENTERPRISES OF OHIO LLC

S\SHARED\BIDS & QUOTES\A-Z Bids & Quotes\BID BOOK HWY CONSTRUCTION AND MAINT. MATERIALS EX 4-30-23\Bid Book 2023-2025\Bid Tabulations\2023 Tabulations\2023H-10

Jefferson County Highway Department Item 1 Item 2 ‘ltem3 Item 4 Item s
ENGINEER ADVANCED PRISMATIC HIGH INTENSITY DIAMOND GRADE FLOURESCENT DIAMONDS
ROLL SIZE WIDTH x 50 GRADE ENGINEER GRADE PRISMATIC CUBED PRISMATIC GRADE CUBED
YARD, $/SQFT PRISMATIC
wo”nm FLECTIVE ROLLS: $iSquare ><wmn_._=m._uw_M=_.=M “.Mu " 3200 / 7300* Series 3400 Series 3930 Series 4090 Series 4081; 4083; 4084 Series
BROWN $1.85/41.21 NO BID $1.41 $2.71 NO BID
YELLOW $1.85/41.21 $1.20 $1.41 $2.74 $2.71
WHITE $1.85/41.21 $1.20 $1.41 $2.71 NO BiD
RED $1.85/41.21 $1.20 $1.41 $2.71 NO BID
GREEN $1.85/51.21 $1.20 $1.41 $2.78 NO BID
BLUE $1.85/51.21 $1.20 $1.41 $2.71 NO BID
ORANGE $1.85/41.21 . NO BID $1.41 NO BID $2.71
LIME GREEN / :
YELLOW GREEN $2.45 NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID - $2.7
i * Is Advanced Flexible Engineer Grade Material
i
b B
: Item 6 ltem 27 Item 8
) Transparent: Non-Reflective APPLICATION TRANSFER]
ROLL SIZEWIDTHX 50| ELECTROCUT FILM ELECTROCUT ROLL SIZE WIDTH x | PRE-SPACE TAPES
YARD, $/SQ FT 100 YARD, $/5Q FT
Available in 6",24", Available in
2) NON REFLECTIVE ROLLS: 30", 36", & 48" 1170 Series 7725 Series ¥ 8",12,18",24",30", & SCPS-2 ***
BROWN §1.22 $3.42 36" $0.36
YELLOW $1.22 $3.12
BLACK (OPAQUE) $1.22 $1.62
RED $1.22 $3.12
GREEN $1.22 $3.12
BLUE $1.22 $3.42
ORANGE $1.22 $3.12 TPM-5
CLEAR $1.01 $3.12. $0.39
WHITE NO BID $1362.00 NOW $3.12%*
*PINK NO BID . $3.12
. *MAGENTA NO BID $3.02
*GOLD NO BID- $3.12
*BIEGE NO BID $3.42
*VIOLET NO BID $3.02
* Film Thickness > 2 Mil
,w **ERROR IN ENTRY - VERIFIED WITH VENDOR.
| -
i -
1ITEM g Diamond Gr Vehicle Conspicuity Tape, 2" x 50 yds, $/Square Foot $5.09

Page 1



A_HIGHWAY SIGNS AND SIGN MATERIALS

BID #2023H-10
HIGRWAY SIGNS, SIGN MATERIALS AND POSTS
BID TABULATION

2023 - 2025 BID PRICING

EASTERN METAL OF ELMIRA INC

LIGHTLE ENTERPRISES OF OHIO LLC

Jefferson County Highway Department
3) REFLECTIVE PAVEMENT MARKING TAPE: White$ /SQFT <mm_M_m_.t Black* $/SQFT White §/SQFT <nm__po<_.mq2 Black* $/SQFT
item g Reflective pavernent Marking Tape: 4" X25yds NO BID NO BID NO BID $2.10 $2.10 $2.80
S Visa Line T T .
>u””“”mhmwﬁu_m emporary Marking Tape or 5"f100 yds NOBID NOBID NO BID $2.10 [ $2.10 $2.80
80| -E! ies Pe it T [ 4",
w..owo_wx:mm ermanent 1ape or equal4% 8% Warious Length NOBID NOBID NO BID $9.28 $9.28 $9.28
N ies P £ T: 69, 12" ”
270 - ES Series Permanet Tape of equal 4, 6% 2" . fous Length NOBID NOBID NOBID $9.28 $9.28 $9.28
. le T. " Gn
Nwmwmwm Temporary Removable Tape 4%, 6" . |, < Length NOBID NOBID NOBID $3.80 $3.80 410
) Add % off Symbols and Legends NO BID NO BID
* Black 700 Series not available in 4" Rolls
: ) : . Roll width X Orange/White | Red White Orange/White | Red White
ftem 10 nt Prismatic Barricade Sheeting 50 Yards SISO T $150 FT &S0 FT SISO FT
3334/3336 or Approved Equal , 6%, 8", 12" NOBID NO BID $2.31 $2.31
Refective sign sticker w/ Removable Backing, LOTS OF
item11  {Variable Dates on 3M 3900 Series or Better 2" x gt NO BID NO BID NO BID $225.00( $450.00 | $675.00 (LOTS OF 1500)
Reflective Material 500)
4) v»m..S)Um.m_oz.nm;z_G- ALUMINUM, at least .080 GAUGE:
Qry SizE SHAPE qQry SIZE SHAPE SIZE SIZE SIZE
100 118" x 18" Diamond 10 Rectangle $12.46 $10.11 18" x 18" $8.66 10" x 30" $8.02
) Rectangle 12" x 12" Diamond $16.38 12" x 12" $5.05 18" x 24" $11.55 12" x 12" $3.85
50 24" x24" Diamond, Shield 50 12¥ x 18" Rectangle $18.00 12" x 18" $7.37 24" x 24" $15.40 12" x 18" $5.78
150 ‘30" x 30" Diamond, Penta 50 2" x24" Rectangle 30" x 30" $27.95 12" x 24" $9.70 30" x 30" $24.06 12" x 24" $7.70
50 36" x 36" Diamond, Penta 50 12" x 30" Rectangle 36" x 36" $41.00 12" x 30", $12.00 36" x 36" $34.65 12" x 30" $9.63
25 48" x 48" Diamond 50 12" x 36" Rectangle 48" x 48" $72.00 12" x 36" $14.41 48" x 48" $61.60 12" x 36" $11.55
150 30" x 30" Octagon, Circle \ 12" x 42" Rectangle 30" x 30" $26.18 12" x 42" $16.72 30" x 30" $23.50 ° 12" x 42" $13.48
10 36" x 36" Octagon, Circle 12" x 48" Rectangle 36" x 36" $36.27 12" x 48" $19.14 36" x 36" $33.95 12" x 48" $15.40
10 48" x 48" Octagon 50 18" x 24" Rectangle 48" x 48" $65.06 18" x 24" $14.45 48" x 48" 461.20 18" x 24" $11.55
10 30" x 30" Yield 50 18" x 30" Rectangle 30" x 30" $15.74 18" x 30" $17.96 30" x 30" $12.90 18" x 30 $14.44
A
10 36" x 36" Yield 50 18" x 36" Rectangle 36" x 36" $19.26 18" x 36" $21.45 36" x 36" $19.88 18" x 36" $17.33
10 6" x 12" Rectangle 50 18" x 48" Rectangle 6" x 12" $3.00 18" x 48" $27.52 6" x 12" $2.10 18" x 48" $23.10
10 6" x18" Rectangle 50 18" x 60" Rectangle 6" x18" 43.80 18" x 60" $3443 &" x 18" $2.95 18" x 60" $28.88
10 6" x24" Rectangle 50 21" x 15" Rectangle 6" x 24" $4.98 21" x 15" $10.57 6" x 29" $3.85 21" x 15" $8.43
10. 6" x 30" Rectangle 24" x15" Rectangle 6" x30" $6.07 24" x 15" $12.00 6" x 30" $4.81 24" x 15" $9.63
10 6" x36" Rectangle 20 24" x30"  |Rectangle, Shield 6" x36" $7.92 24"x 30" $24.80 6" x 36" 35.78 24" x 30" $19.25
10 6" x 48" Rectangle 50 24" x 36" Rectangle 6" x 48" $9.76 24" x 36" 327.24 6" x 48" $7.70 24" x36" $23.10
10 8" x18" Rectangle 100 24" x 48" Rectangle 8" x 18" $5.04 24" x 48" $36.47 8" x 18" $3.85 24" x 48" $30.80
10 8" x24" Rectangle 50 24" x 60" Rectangle 8" x 24" $6.58 24" x 60" $45.72 8" x24" i $5.16 24" x 60" $38.50
10 - 8" x30" Rectangle 20 24" x 72" Rectangle 8"x30" $8.19 $54.09 8" X 3 $6.42 24" x 72 $46.20
10 8" x 36" Rectangle 50 24" x 84" Rectangle 8" x 36" $9.76 361.04 8" x 36" $7.70 24" x 84 $53.90
10 8"x 48" Rectangle 30" x 15" Rectangle $12.85 30" x 15 $14.50 8" x 48" $10.29 30" x 15" $12.05
200 4" xq" - Rectangle 10 30" x 36" Rectangle $2.40 30" x 36" $34.33 4"x4" $0.80 30" x 36/ $28.88
10 Rectangle 10 36" x 48" Rectangle $9.00 36" x 48" $54.87 3"x72" $5-78 36" x 48" $46.20
10 Rectangle 10 36" x 60" Rectangle $3.88 36" x 60" $68.49 9" xn" $1.95 36" x 60" $57-75
10 36" x 72" - Rectangle 36" x 72" $81.04 $69.30
10 36" x 96" Rectangle 36" x 96" $106.66 $92.40
10 48" x 96" Rectangle - 48"x 96" $143.93 $123.20
10 60"x 12" Rectangle 60"x 12" $34.43 60"x 12" $19.25

S:\SHARED\BIDS & QUOTES\A-Z Bids & Quotes\BID BOOK HWY CONSTRUCTION AND MAINT. MATERIALS EX 4-30-23\Bid Book 2023-2025\Bid Tabulations\2023 Tabulations\2023H-10
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A HIGHWAY SIGNS AND SIGN MATERIALS

BID #2023H-10

HIGHWAY SIGNS, SIGN MATERIALS AND POSTS

BID TABULATION
2023 - 2025 BID PRICING
EASTERN METAL OF ELMIRA INC . . LIGHTLE ENTERPRISES OF OHIO L1.C
Jefferson County Highway Department .
5) COMPLETE SIGNS: PRICE EACH PRICE EACH
MUTCD # “__MM”_.ME SIZE Class A Flourescent Orange Construction Signs 3200 &for 7900 Series SIZE Class A Flourescent Orange Construction Signs 3200 8/or 7900 Series
ANY Class D MUTCD Sign, by size 18" X18" $29.77 18" X 18" $14.49
Quantity 24" x 24" $50.42 XXX - XXX XXX 24" x 24" 425.76 XXX XXX XX
24" x 30" . $62.66 XXX XX XXX 24"x 30" $32.20 XXX XX XX
30" x 30" $76.44 XXX XXX XXX 30" x 30" $40.25 XXX XXX XX
36" x12" $39.66 XXX peed XXX 36" x 12" $19.32 XXX XXX XXX
36" x 24" $77.27 XXX XXX XXX 36" x 24" $38.64 XXX XXX XXX
36" x36" $114.30 XXX XXX XXX 36" x 36" - 857.96 XXX XXX XXX
48" x 18" $76.20 XXX B XX XXX 48" x 18" $38.64 XXX XXX XX
60" x 36" $188.90 XXX X0 XXX 60" x 36" $96.60 XX XXX XK
5a) $ DISCOUNT FROM LIST FOR ITEMS NOT LISTED ON THIS BID PAGE: X NO BID - . NO BID
HIGH INTENSITY DIAMOND GRADE | FLOURESCENT DIAMOND | FLOURESCENT DIAMOND | FLOURESCENT DIAMOND HIGH INTENSITY DIAMOND GRADE | FLOURESCENT DIAMOND | FLOURESCENT DIAMOND | FLOURESCENT DIAMOND
. CUBED PRISMATIC GRADE CUBED GRADE CUBED ‘GRADE CUBED CUBED PRISMATIC GRADE CUBED GRADE CUBED GRADE CUBED
PRISMATIC (Class 8) v Eu_“ums PRISMATIC (Class E) E_mg»ﬁn_m_n_nwu E) vz_m_sﬂ_mﬂn_mﬂ €) PRISMATIC (Class B) ! E.unmmv PRISMATIC (Class E) PRISMATIC (Class E) PRISMATIC (Class E}
: SIZE 3930 Serles 4050 Series 4084 (Orange) 4081 International Yellow | 4083 (Yellow Green) SIZE 3930 Serles 4090 Serles 4084 (Orange) 4081 International Yellow| 4083 (Yellow Green)
6" x24" $11.81 $16.53 $16.53 $16.53 $16.53 $6.44 $8.30 $8.40 $8.30 $8.30
- 9"x 48" $26.55 $37.16 $37:16 . 33716 $3716 $19.32 $24.90 $25.30 $24.90 $24.90
. 2"x 8" $21.41 $29.97 $9.97 $29.97 $29.97 $520 $5.70 $5.80 $5.70 $5.70
12" x g" $9.51 $13.82 $13.82 $13.82 $13.82 $5.60 $6.40 $6.50 $6.40 $6.40
4 12" x 10" $10.02 $14.17 $14.17 $14.17 $14.17 =" x10" $6.10 $6.92 $6.98 $6.92 $6.92
REQUEST FULL PRICE QUOTE WITH GRAPHIC OR TEXT AS PER 2"x15" $14.21 " $19.8¢ $19.89 $19.89 $19.89 2" x15" $8.30 $10.40 $10.52 $10.40 $10.40
MUTCD OR NY SUPPLEMENT SIGN NUMBER SUPPLIED UPON ORDER 12"x18" $15.49 $21.69 $21.69 $21.69 $21.69 12" x 18" $9.66 $12.45 $12.75 $12.45 $12.45
12" x 24" $20.41° $28.56 $28.56 428.56 $28.56 12" x 24" $12.88 $16.60 $16.80 $16.60 $16.60
2% 36" $27.39 $38.34 $38.34 $38.3¢ $38.34 2"x36" $19.32 - $24.90 $25.30 $24.90 $24.90
12" x 48" $47.93 §67.12 §67.12 $67.2 $67.12 12" x48" $25.76 43320 43320 $33.20 $33-20
2" x 60" $48.95 $68.47 $68.47 $68.47 $68.42 12" x 60" $32.20 $41.50 $41.50 $41.50 $41.50
2" X72" $58.07 $81.29 $81.29 $81.29 $81.29 2" X72" $38.64 $49-80 450.50 $49.80 $49.80
15" x 15" $20.34 528.47 $28.47 $28.47 $28.47 ;%" x 15" $10.10 412.95 $13.09 $12.95 $12.95
15" x 18" $22.88 $32.07 $32.07 $32.07 $32.07 15" x 18" 412,20 $15.56 $15.75 $15.56 $15.56
15" x 21" $20.81 $29.14 $29.14 $29.14 $29.14 5" x 2" $14.10 $18.18 $18.42 $18.18 $18.18
15" x 24" $24.34 $34.07 $34.07 $34.07 $34.07 15" x24" $16.10 $§20.75 4$20.98 $20.75 $20.75
15" x 30" “$28.59 $40.02 $40.02 $40.02 $40.02 15" x 30" $20.16 $25-94 $26.20 $25.94 $25.94
18" x 6" 48.03 $11.00 . $11.00 $11.00 $11.00 18"x 6" $4.95 $6.30 $6.40 $6.30 $6.30
18" x 8" $11.17 $15.66 $15.66 $15.66 $15.66 18" x 8" $6.60 $8.30 $8.40 $8.30 $8.30
18" x12" $15.24 $21.33 $21.33 $21.33 $21.33 18" x 12" $9.66 $12.45 ) $12.60 $12.45 412,45
18" x 18" $21.31 $20.83 $29.83 $29.83 $29.83 18" x 18 $14.49 $18.68 $18.90 $18.68 $18.68
18" x 24" $27.39 $38.84 $38.84 $38.84 $38.84 18" x 24" $19.32 $24.90 $25.20 $24.90 $24.90
18" x 30" $30.61 $42.86 $42.86 $42.86 $42.86 18" x 30" $24.15 33113 $31.45 $31.13 $31.13
. 8"x36" $41.09 $57.52 $57.52 457.52 $57.52 18x36" | $28.98 $37-35 $37.80 $37-35 43735
18" x 48" $54.78 $76.96 $76.96 $76.96 576.96 18" x 48" 438.64 $49.80 450.40 $49.80 $49.80
18" x 60" $68.48 $95.87 $95.87 $95.87 $95.87 ° 18" x 60" $48.30 $62.25 $63.00 $62.25 $62.25
21" x 154 $20.81 $29.14 529.14 4$29.14 $29.14 21" x 15" $14.10 $18.18 $18.40 $18.18 $18.18 ~
24" x 8 $14.90 $20.86 $20.86 $20.86 $20.86 24" x 8" $8.59 1112 $11.25 $n.2 $1112
24" x 12" $31.07 $43.51 $43.51 $43.51 $43.51 24" x 12" $12.88 $16.60 $16.80 $16.60 $16.60
24"x18" s $38.34 43834 $38.34 $38.34 24"x18" $19.32 $24.90 $25.20 $2490 $24.90
) 24" x 24" 43653 $51.73 $51.73 $5173 $51.73 24" x24" $25.76 $3320 $33.60 $33.20 $33.20
) 24"x30" $45.65 $63.90 $63.90 $63.90 $63.90 24" x 30" $32.20 $41.50 $42.00 $41.50 $41.50
R 24" x 36" 458.78 $76.69 $76.69 $76.69 $76.69 24" x 36" $38.64 $29.88 $30.48 $29.88 $29.88
24" x 48" 4$73.04 $102.26 $102.26 $102.26 $102.26 24" x 48" $51.52 $66.40 $67.20 $66.40 $66.40
24" x 60" $91.31 $127.83 $127.83 $127.83 $127.83 24" x 60" $64.40 $88.30 $89.30 $88.30 $88.30
A 30" x 8" $172.26 524.16 $24.16 $24.16 $24.16 30" x 8" $10.85 $13.84 $14.00 $13:84 $13.84
K 30" x 10" $21.73 $30.44 $30.44 $30.44 $30.44 30" x 10" $13.42 $15.60 $15.85 $15.60 $15.60.
STOP (OCTAGON) Ri-1 B 30" x 30 $57.06 $79.89 $79-89 $79-89 $79.89 30" x 30" $39.50 $51.88 $52.50 45188 451.88
STOP (OCTAGON) Ri-t H 36" x 36" $77.31 $108.22 $108.22 $108.22 $108.22 36" x 36" 4$57.60 $74.50 $74.50 $74-50 $74.50
STOP {OCTAGON) Ri-1 K 48" x 48" 454.05 $75.68 $75.68 $75.68 $75.68 48" x 48" $102.60 $132.50 $132.50 $132.50 $132.50
YEILD (Triangle) Rt-2 . 30" $30.75 $43.05 $43.05 $43.05 $43.05 30" $21.57 $27.82 $27.82 $27.82 $27.82
YEILD (Triangle) R1-2 ) 36" $42.01 - $58.81 458.81 458.81 $58.81 36" $29.30 $37.60 4$37.60 $37.60 $37.60
B 36"x 8" $21.95 $30.73 $30.73 $30.73 $30.73 36" x 8" $12.88 $16.60 $16.80 $16.60 $16.60
. 36" x 12" $27.12 $38.34 $38.34 $38.34 438.34 36" x " $19.32 $24.90 $25.20 $24-90 $24.90
136" x18" - $41.09 $57.61 $57.61 $52.61 $57.61 36" x 18" $28.98 $37.35 $37.80 $37.35 $37:35

"S\SHARED\BIDS & QUOTES\A-Z Bids & Quotes\BID BOOK HWY CONSTRUCTION AND MAINT. MATERIALS EX 4-30-23\Bid Book 2023-2025\Bid Tabulations\2023 Tabulations\2023H-10
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B. STEEL FENCE AND SIGN POSTS

BID #2023H-10
HIGHWAY SIGNS, SIGN MATERIALS AND POSTS
BID TABULATION

2023 -2025 BID PRICING
CHEMUNG SUPPLY CORP EASTERN METAL OF ELMIRA INC EBERL IRON WORKS INC
Jefferson County Highway .
PAINTED | GALVANIZED PAINTED | GALVANIZED PAINTED | GALVANIZED
POSTS POSTS POSTS POSTS POSTS POSTS
FENCE POSTS: SNOW MARKER DELINEATORS 'SNOW MARKER DELINEATORS 'SNOW MARKER DELINEATORS
500, /- 6 FT. LENGTH, - [
APPROX. 1.12 LBS./FT. $6.60 $9.06 SNOW POLE $1220 41520 |SNOW POLE $0.21EA sn2zEA _ |SNOWPOLE
i 250, +/- 250, +/- 250, +/-
72", ORANGE W/REFLECTIVE TAPE AND METAL CAP NOBID 72", ORANGE W/REFLECTIVE TAPE AND METAL CAP. $3:30 72", ORANGE W/REFLECTIVE TAPE AND METAL CAP NOBID
MARION RIB-BACKED U CHANNEL 3/8" HOLES ON 1
CENTER PUNCHED FULL LENGTH
250, +/- 250, +f 250, +f-
500, 4/, 4 FT. LENGTH, 72", LIME GREEN W/REFLECTIVE TAPE AND METAL CAP NOBID 72", LIME GREEN W/REFLECTIVE TAPE AND METAL CAP $330 72", LIME GREEN W/REFLECTIVE TAPE AND METAL CAP NOBID
APPROX. 3 LBS/FT. sz S15.44 T $2065 $27.60 T $15.75 EA $18.94 EA I I
200, +/- 6 FT. LENGTH, SNOW POLE/STAKES DELINEATORS SNOW POLE/STAKES DELINEATORS SNOW POLE/STAKES DELINEATORS
APPROX. 2 LBS./FT, $n3q $15.36 I $20.65 $27.60 [ $15.75 EA $19.35EA |
REFLECTIVE TAPE AND METAL CAP NOBID REFLECTIVE TAPE AND METAL CAP. NOBID _ REFLECTIVE TAPE AND METAL CAP NOBID
I . I [
; 72", FIBERGLASS FLOURESCENT LIME GREEN 72", FIBERGLASS FLOURESCENT LIME GREEN 72", FIBERGLASS FLOURESCENT LIME GREEN
500, +/-, 10 FT. LENGTH, WJREFLECTIVE TAPE AND METAL CAP' NOBID W/REFLECTIVE TAPE AND METAL CAP - NOBID - W/REFLECTIVE TAPE AND METAL CAP NOBID
APPROX. 3 LBS./FT. $28.38 $37.54 $50.01 $64.81 $36.79 EA $44.76 EA
DELINEATOR POSTS:
500, +/- 6 FT. LENGTH, :
APPROX. 1.5 LBS.[FT. NOBID NOBID $24.81 $31.76 NOBID NOBID
MARION LAP SPLICE BREAK-A-WAY SYSTEM RIB-BAK
"Gold Bar"
1,000 +f- _s8.50 NOBID $7.44EA
Page 4
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