

County of Jefferson

Office of the Purchasing Department
Historic Court House
195 Arsenal Street
Watertown, New York 13601-2565
Phone: 315-785-3077
Fax: 315-785-7591



Buyers
Karin Dorr
Amanda McCracken

Director
Mark Sachetti, CPPB

Email Addresses:
marks@co.jefferson.ny.us
karind@co.jefferson.ny.us
amccracken@co.jefferson.ny.us
avisg@co.jefferson.ny.us
mshear@co.jefferson.ny.us

Senior Account Clerk
Avis Gilmore

Account Clerk
Mary Ann Shear

NOTICE OF AWARD

APRIL 5, 2021

ATTN MARK W THOMPSON
JEFFERSON CONCRETE CORP.
22850 COUNTY ROUTE 51
WATERTOWN NY 13601

BID #2021H-17a

NAME: PRECAST CONCRETE DECKING PANELS

CONTRACT PERIOD: MAY 1, 2021 THROUGH APRIL 30, 2023

Dear Mr. Thompson,

I am pleased to inform you that your Bid submitted for the solicitation referenced has been accepted based on full compliance with the specifications, terms and conditions included in the Bid.

The following documents are required before a Contract/Purchase Order is issued:

- ✓ Insurance Certificate - Commercial General Liability, Business Automobile Liability
- ✓ W-9 Tax Form (Attached)
- ✓ Other: Please note that Jefferson County must be listed on your Insurance certificates as an additional insured as noted in the bid document under Insurance Requirements.

If you have any questions regarding this notice of award please call the Jefferson County Purchasing Department.

Sincerely,


Mark Sachetti, Purchasing Director
C: Department, Auditor, Bid File

**BID # 2021H - 17a
 PRECAST CONCRETE DECKING PANELS
 BID TABULATIONS**

Prestressed Concrete Panel/Beams w/ Bearings (elastomeric)

3' Panel																	
Length (FT)	8	10	12	14	16	18	20	22	24	26	28	30	32	34	36	38	40
Straight	\$336.00	\$317.00	\$281.00	\$252.00	\$237.00	\$232.00	\$221.00	\$215.00	\$289.00	\$275.00	\$278.00	\$269.00	\$251.00	\$240.00	\$232.00	\$224.00	\$253.00
Skewed	\$336.00	\$317.00	\$281.00	\$252.00	\$237.00	\$232.00	\$221.00	\$215.00	\$289.00	\$275.00	\$278.00	\$269.00	\$251.00	\$240.00	\$232.00	\$224.00	\$253.00
Bearings	No BID	No BID	No BID	No BID	No BID	No BID	No BID	No BID	No BID	No BID	No BID	No BID	No BID	No BID	No BID	No BID	No BID
3' Panel																	
Length (FT)	42	44	46	48	50	52	54	56	58	60	62	64	66	68	70	72	74
Straight	\$252.00	\$246.00	\$238.00	\$233.00	\$242.00	\$235.00	\$229.00	\$223.00	\$227.00	\$278.00	\$271.00	\$272.00	\$266.00	\$263.00	\$265.00	\$260.00	\$255.00
Skewed	\$252.00	\$246.00	\$238.00	\$233.00	\$242.00	\$235.00	\$229.00	\$223.00	\$227.00	\$278.00	\$271.00	\$272.00	\$266.00	\$263.00	\$265.00	\$260.00	\$255.00
Bearings	No BID	No BID	No BID	No BID	No BID	No BID	No BID	No BID	No BID	No BID	No BID	No BID	No BID	No BID	No BID	No BID	No BID
3' Panel																	
Length (FT)	76	78	80	82	84	86	88	90	92	94	96	98	100	102	104		
Straight	\$257.00	\$256.00	\$262.00	\$264.00	\$257.00	\$258.00	\$261.00	\$258.00	\$257.00	\$254.00	\$251.00	\$247.00	\$245.00	\$244.00	\$241.00		
Skewed	\$257.00	\$256.00	\$262.00	\$264.00	\$257.00	\$258.00	\$261.00	\$258.00	\$257.00	\$254.00	\$251.00	\$247.00	\$245.00	\$244.00	\$241.00		
Bearings	No BID	No BID	No BID	No BID	No BID	No BID	No BID	No BID	No BID	No BID	No BID	No BID	No BID	No BID	No BID		
4' Panel																	
Length (FT)	8	10	12	14	16	18	20	22	24	26	28	30	32	34	36	38	40
Straight	\$422.00	\$358.00	\$324.00	\$299.00	\$290.00	\$280.00	\$268.00	\$254.00	\$350.00	\$357.00	\$338.00	\$320.00	\$308.00	\$294.00	\$281.00	\$271.00	\$306.00
Skewed	\$422.00	\$358.00	\$324.00	\$299.00	\$290.00	\$280.00	\$268.00	\$254.00	\$350.00	\$357.00	\$338.00	\$320.00	\$308.00	\$294.00	\$281.00	\$271.00	\$306.00
Bearings	No BID	No BID	No BID	No BID	No BID	No BID	No BID	No BID	No BID	No BID	No BID	No BID	No BID	No BID	No BID	No BID	No BID
4' Panel																	
Length (FT)	42	44	46	48	50	52	54	56	58	60	62	64	66	68	70	72	74
Straight	\$305.00	\$296.00	\$288.00	\$281.00	\$289.00	\$281.00	\$275.00	\$267.00	\$266.00	\$315.00	\$307.00	\$309.00	\$302.00	\$303.00	\$302.00	\$296.00	\$292.00
Skewed	\$305.00	\$296.00	\$288.00	\$281.00	\$289.00	\$281.00	\$275.00	\$267.00	\$266.00	\$315.00	\$307.00	\$309.00	\$302.00	\$303.00	\$302.00	\$296.00	\$292.00
Bearings	No BID	No BID	No BID	No BID	No BID	No BID	No BID	No BID	No BID	No BID	No BID	No BID	No BID	No BID	No BID	No BID	No BID
Length (FT)	76	78	80	82	84	86	88	90	92	94	96	98	100	102	104		
	\$293.00	\$292.00	\$298.00	\$302.00	\$294.00	\$295.00	\$299.00	\$295.00	\$294.00	\$291.00	\$288.00						

