County of Jefferson

Office of the Purchasing Department
Historic Court House

195 Arsenal Street

Watertown, New York 13601-2565
Phone: 315-785-3077

Fax: 315-785-7591

Buyers Director
Karin Dorr Mark Sachetti, CPPB

Amanda McCracken

Email Addresses:
marks@co.jefferson.ny.us
karind@co.jefferson.ny.us

amccracken@co.jefferson.ny.us
avisg@co.jefferson.ny.us
mshear@co.jefferson.ny.us

Senior Account Clerk
Avis Gilmore

Account Clerk
Mary Ann Shear

NOTICE OF AWARD
June 16, 2020

Mr. Jeffrey Karam
Imperial Cleaning Service
727 N Salina Street
Syracuse NY 13208

BID #20-20 NAME: CLEANING SERVICES FOR JEFFERSON COUNTY POLLING SITES

CONTRACT PERIOD: DATE OF AWARD THROUGH FINAL COMPLETION AND ACCEPTANCE

Dear Mr. Karam:

I am pleased to inform you that your Bid submitted for the solicitation referenced has been accepted based on full

compliance with the specifications, terms and conditions included in the Bid.
The following documents are required before a Purchase Order is issued:

V W-g Tax Form and Vendor Information Form (Attached)

If youhaveqny questions regarding this notice of award, please call the Jefferson County Purchasing Department.

Vlark Sachetti
Purchasing Director

MS/am

C.  Department, Auditor, Bid File, ServPro
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BID #20-20
CLEANING SERVICES FOR JEFFERSON COUNTY POLLING SITES
BID TABULATION

IMPERIAL CLEANING SERVICE SERVPRO OF JEFFERSON COUNTY
CLEANING CLEANING CLEANING CLEANING
LOCATION PRE-ELECTIONS POST-ELECTIONS PRE-ELECTIONS POST-ELECTIONS
TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE

Adams Municipal Building $1,250.00 $1,250.00
Alexandria Town Office $2,500.00 $2,500.00
Antwerp Town Office $720.00 $720.00
Rutland Town Office $740.00 $740.00
Dexter Village Office *** NO BID NO BID
E:::)ke Vincent Recreation NOBID NGRS
Carthage High School $1,100.00 $1,100.00
Church of the Nazarene $1,266.00 $1,266.00
Town of Lyme Office $375.00 $375.00
Clayton Municipal Building $858.00 $858.00)
Ellisburg Town Office $650.00 $650.00
Evans Mills Fire Hall NO BID NO BID
Henderson Town Office NO BID NO BID
Orleans Town Off $400.00 $400.00
Lorraine Town Office NO BID NO BID
Worth Town Office NO BID NO BID
Philadelphia Fire Hall $600.00 $600.00
Rodman Community Hall NO BID NO BID
Theresa Fire Hall $1,050.00 $1,050.00
Hounsfield Town Office $600.00 $600.00
Life Church of the Nazarene $1,500.00 $1,500.00 :
Midtown Towers NO BID NO BID
Our Lady of the Sacred 1.356,05 ——
Heart Church

Pamelia Town Office $750.00 $750.00
Stone Presbyterian Church $1,260.00 $1,260.00
Watertown Fire Hall $962.00 $962.00
TOTAL $17,831.00 $17,831.00

ALL DATA IS PRELIMINARY AND DOCUMENTED AT THE TIME OF BID OPENING, SUBJECT TO ERRORS OR OMISSIONS.
THIS DATA SHOULD NOT BE INTERPRETED AS CONFIRMATION OF BID RESULTS UNLESS SIGNED BY THE JEFFERSON COUNTY PURCHASING DEPARTMENT.
THIS BID TABULATION DOES NOT IMPLY AN AWARD S BEEN MADE UNLESS NOTED.
7 Z A whslz20
PURCHASING DATE
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